Freedom of Information Act 2000 – spend on environmental services
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1.
How large, in hectares, is the administrative area of your authority?

7,334 hectares

2.
What was your total budget for the council in the financial years;

a.
2009/10

b.
2010/11

c.
2011/12

d.
2012/13

e.
2013/14

For your information this letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, e.g. the Council Website.

The Council's budgets are in the public domain, and can be found here:  http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/performance-and-spending
3.
What was your gross expenditure for the council in the financial years;

a.
2009/10

b.
2010/11

c.
2011/12

d.
2012/13

e.
2013/14

As above, the Council's accounts are in the public domain, and can be found here: http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/performance-and-spending/statement-of-accounts
4.
How much money was spent on environmental services (using the definition for environment services as set out by the CIPFA service reporting code of practice for local authorities (SeRCOP) under environmental regulatory services) in the financial years

a.
2009/10

b.
2010/11

c.
2011/12

d.
2012/13

e.
2013/14

Please see details in the attached spreadsheet

5.
How much money was spent on the control (including, prevention, control, management, education and survey) of all non-native flora and fauna (e.g. Japanese Knotweed and Colorado Beetle species) in the financial years;

a.
2009/10
Information not held
b.
2010/11
Information not held
c.
2011/12
£8,756.85
d.
2012/13
£19,460.37
e.
2013/14
£2,535.00

The above are cost spent on treatment of Japanese Knotweed from 2011/12.

There are no figures prior to 2011 as we did not actively treat Japanese Knotweek, therefore this part of the letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
6.
Do you have a strategy relating to the control of non-native species (including prevention, control, management, education and survey), if so, can you provide a copy or provide a link?

We do not have a strategy relating to the control of non-native species, therefore this is a refusal notice in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act.  Work is in progress on the development of a policy.

7.
How much is spent on this strategy in the financial years;

a.
2009/10

b.
2010/11

c.
2011/12

d.
2012/13

e.
2013/14

Not applicable
The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Information Governance
City Barrister & Head of Standards
1st Floor
16 New Walk
LEICESTER LE1 6UB 
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.
