Freedom of Information Act 2000  
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. There are currently 4588 adults living in your area who have had a stroke. How many of those people have you ever arranged, or are you currently providing, any form of social care support for? (Please mark an X next to the appropriate figure then please indicate whether this is an estimate or based on an exact figure)

Less than 20%

Between 20% and 50%

Between 50% and 70%

Between 70% and 90%

Over 90%

All

Don’t know  x 

Estimate/ Based on exact figure

Answer:

For your information, this letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

2. There are currently 2593 adults living with Heart Failure* in your area. How many of those people have you ever arranged, or are you currently providing, any form of social care support for? (Please mark an X next to the appropriate figure then please indicate whether this is an estimate or based on an exact figure)

*Heart failure is a condition that means that for some reason the heart is not pumping blood around the body as well as it should. The most common reason is that the heart muscle has been damaged, for example after a heart attack. The main symptoms of heart failure are shortness of breath, swelling - of your feet, ankles, stomach and lower back areas - and fatigue.

Less than 20%

Between 20% and 50%

Between 50% and 70%

Between 70% and 90%

Over 90%

All

Don’t know  x
Estimate/ Based on exact figure
For your information, this letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

3. How many of those currently receiving social care support in your area receive a personal budget for their support? (Please mark an X next to the appropriate figure then please indicate whether this is an estimate or based on an exact figure)

Less than 20%

Between 20% and 50%

Between 50% and 70%

Between 70% and 90%

Over 90% x - this answer relates to all adults receiving social care support from Leicester City Council, not just those detailed in Q1 or 2.
All

Don’t know   

Estimate/ Based on exact figure

4. How well do you think health and social care work together in a joined up way for patients in your area?** Please circle a number from 1 to 10 where 1 is extremely well and 10 is not at all well

1         2         3         4          5        6         7         8         9         10 

**This question is not obligatory under FOI legislation, though we would be extremely grateful for your response.

As you have indicated, this is not a question under FOI legislation as it is a request for opinion, not information held.  However, on a scale of 1-10 we believe the way in which health and social care work together in a joined up way for patients in our area would be given a rating of 8.  
The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Information Governance

City Barrister & Head of Standards

1st Floor, 16 New Walk

Leicester

LE1 6UB

e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.
