Freedom of Information Act 2000 
You asked:

1) How many registered businesses are there within your Local Authority Area?
12,109

2) How many of those businesses are classified as SMEs (Small and Medium Enterprises)?
This information is not held by the Council as we would not know which businesses would be classified as SMEs based on the business rates database.  Therefore this part of the letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.  
3) Do you provide a commercial waste/recycling collection service to businesses in your Local Authority Area, and if not, then why not?

Yes, see point 4.

Additionally in order to minimise the number of waste collection vehicles in the city centre we do provide a limited waste collection service to businesses in the city centre who request the service and are willing to purchase trade refuse sacks specifically for this purpose.

4) Do you operate commercial waste collections under a commercial contract with terms and conditions that are individually negotiated with businesses (commercial waste producers)?

Leicester City Council contracts the collection, treatment and disposal of waste to Biffa Leicester Ltd under a 25 year PFI contract. A condition of this contract is the provision of a trade refuse collection service in accordance with the needs and frequencies to be determined with trade customers.

5) Please provide a blank example copy of your contract, including any terms and conditions of commercial service supply.

N/A

6) Does this contract typically involve a minimum term? If yes please state the typical minimum term e.g. 12 months.

N/A

7) What is the total number of businesses in your Local Authority Area, to which you currently supply a commercial waste OR recycling service to.

155 (as per the city centre service under Q3)
8) Do you provide a waste/recycling service to any businesses outside of your Local Authority area, and if so, to what additional Local Authority area(s) do you supply these services into?
No

9) For each additional Local Authority area such services are supplied into, as identified in Q.5, then if applicable, please state how many businesses in those areas you supply?

N/A

10) Do you make a Profit Margin/Surplus on commercial waste collections and if so, what is that Profit Margin?

Break even (as per the city centre service under Q3)
11) Do you have any staff/officers employed (either in whole, or in part) in a Commercial Waste Sales capacity, in the course of their duties? If yes, then please also supply the number of employees and job titles, as well as details of any other duties they perform, e.g. enforcement.

N/A

12) Please provide the percentage (or a genuine estimate of the percentage) of commercial waste customers that require you to collect commercial waste, on their understanding that, they simply cannot obtain this same service from any other service provider in the area?
0
The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Information and Support
Leicester City Council

Bosworth House

9 – 15 Princess Road West
LEICESTER LE1 6TH 
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.

