Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. Please can you clearly define what is meant by the following extract of Legislation

Leicestershire Act 1985. C.xvii
(7th line of first paragraph)

“Certain local statutory provisions should continue to apply to the area, things or persons to which or to whom they applied before 1st April 1974” 

What are the local statutory provisions, mentioned in the Act.

Which persons, did the local statutory provisions apply to before 1974.

Answer:
Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 a request is only a valid request if it is for recorded information.  This question is seeking an opinion on the meaning of specific legislation and this is therefore not factual information held by Leicester City Council.  Therefore this constitutes a refusal notice under s17 of the Act as it is information not held. 

2. Does Leicester City Council have a charter granted to it, by Queen Elizabeth II, that defines and describes, its powers, duties, and obligations.

No

3. Does Leicester City Council have the power to bill, precept or make demands for money, from natural persons, if it has been granted the power to do so, please kindly direct us to the Law, or to the relevant Local Government Finance Act, which is deemed to apply.

As response to Q1 above
4. Is Leicester City Council, a Trade Name

Is Leicester City Council a for profit trading Company/Corporation,

Is Leicester City Council registered at Companies house, as being a Company/Corporation.

Are Leicester Ctiy Council bound by the rules of the Business Names Act 1985. C7

As response to Q1 above
5. How was the position “City Mayor” created, in 2011.

(a) Was the decision to create the position (City Mayor) made by Leicester City Council Members only, Or

(b) Was there a referendum, whereby all of the people who ae registered as living in any (1) one of the (21) Twenty One Wards, were given the opportunity to vote on the matter.
We have searched for the information on the matter, and have found the following extract.

Published: 4 May 2011 From the section UK Politics www.bbc.com/.../uk-politics-13212671
In addition, there will be a UK parliamentary by-election in Leicester South as well mayoral elections in Leicester, Torbay, Bedford, Middlesborough and Mansfield.
Thursday 5 May

7am: Polls open for elections to the Scottish Parliament, Welsh Assembly, Northern Ireland Assembly, Eglish and Northern Irish councils, for the alternative vote referendum and the Leicester South by-election.
Friday 6 May

0730: Counting starts in the Leicester South UK by-election
2000: The result of the Leicester South UK parliamentary is expected by now.  However, it could be much earlier.

Would it be correct to say that the said position “City Mayor” is another name for “Chief Executive Officer” for Leicester City Council.
This was via a decision of the Full Council.  It would not be correct to say that the position “City Mayor” is another name for “Chief Executive Officer” for Leicester City Council.
6. What Law, Custom or Tradition is Council Tax based upon.

Council tax is based upon law – the Local Government Finance Act, 1992.

7. Why are people’s names written in all capital letters, on the “Council Tax” demands, which are issued to people by Leicester City Council.

This is a feature of our computer system, and aids clarity of reading for the intended recipient.

8. Is the “Council Tax” scheme deemed to be a contract and/or agreement between Leicester City Council and its citizens, those who are registered as living in (1) on of the (21) Twenty One Wards in the County Borough (City) of Leicester.

The council tax scheme is not a contract, it is a tax which is raised under the provisions of the Act quoted above.
9. If Council Tax charges are deemed to be a contract/agreement between Leicester City Council and its citizens, where, or how can we obtain a copy of the contract/agreement, so that we can review its terms and conditions.

Not applicable.

10. Please can you give us a break down of all the services that are provided by Leicester City Council, and a break down of how those charges are calculated.

Example: For an individual who is charged and deemed liable to pay Council Tax.

Registered at North Evington Ward, Single person. Valuation Band A
For your information this constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, e.g. the Council Website, as it is already in the public domain.

The services of the City Council are included in the accounts and the budget book, which can be found on the Council’s website:
http://www.leicester.gov.uk/media/177052/budget-book-2013-14.pdf
11. What was the overall Gross amount of funds, that were raised from Council Tax, for the financial year (2013-2014) for each of the (21) Twenty One Wards, please provide the combined total.

Funds raised are shown in the Council’s accounts for 2013/14: http://www.leicester.gov.uk/media/179028/statement-of-accounts-2013-14-leicester-city-council.pdf.

Funds are not collated with reference to wards.  Therefore this part of the letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the Council.
12. Are the funds which are raised/collected from Council Tax deposited into a Bank Account

What is the name of the bank, where the funds are deposited.

What is the name of the account holder.

The Council’s council tax income is deposited with Barclays Bank.  The account holder is Leicester City Council.

13. Please explain what the funds, raised/collected for Council Tax, are used for.

The use of funds raised and collected for council tax is explained in the accounts/budget books referred to above.
15. Does Leicester City Council, charge Council Tax, to the various police stations that are scattered around Leicester (city) county Borough.  What Council Tax Band do police stations fall into.  Or are they exempt from paying council Tax.

Council Tax is only due from domestic residences.  National Non-Domestic rates is payable on commercial, industrial and administrative properties, including police stations.

16. Do the Executive members of Leicester City council pay Council Tax

Executive Members of the City Council are liable to pay council tax in the same way as any other member of the public.

17. Do any of the funds which are raised from Council Tax, go towards paying wages to the members and employees of Leicester City Council.

Funds from the council tax are used to contribute to the entirety of the Council’s budget, which includes wages to our employees and expenses of Members.
18. People who are unable to keep up payments of Council Tax,or who fall behind in payments are usually summonsed to Tribunal.  Why are those Tribunal hearings always held in private.

The recovery process for unpaid Council Tax, laid down in The Local Government Finance Act 1992, includes hearings at a Magistrates Court where required.  The hearings are public, not private.  Appeals against decisions made by the Council in respect of some aspects of Council Tax administration are heard in Tribunals, which are also public hearings. 

See http://info.valuation-tribunals.gov.uk/

19. Please can Leicester City Council provide the Law and/or cause of action, nature of the offence alleged to have been committed, in regards to someone who has been summonsed to court, for falling behind in payments, or for not paying Council Tax.  Bearing in mind that for a debt to exist, there must have been some form of agreement in existence, that had been freelin entered into between the parties.

Council tax is a tax, its enforcement is provided for by law under the provisions of legislation.

20. Can an individual opt out of the Council Tax schme, is there a clause in the terms and conditions of the contract/agreement that permits such action, or are individuals forced to comply and take part in the scheme….

An individual cannot opt out of council tax.

21. What provisions do Leicester City Council have in place, that deals whith issues concerning diversity of citizenship, in regards to Natural Persons, people such as Moorish American Nationals, who are not its citizens, and do not wish to be classified as citizens of its Fictitious Corporate state, commonly referred to as Leicester City, which consists of man made artificial boundaries, that have been created and form its (21) twenty one wards.

The Equality Act 2010 focuses on the right of people to not be discriminated against because of who they are or what makes them different from other people. These factors are called protected characteristics, and the Equality Act has nine protected characteristics: 

· age, 

· disability, 

· gender reassignment/gender identity, 

· pregnancy and maternity, 

· race, 

· religion or belief, 

· sex/gender, 

· sexual orientation 

· and for specific situations, marriage and civil partnership. 

The council, as a local authority, has additional responsibilities as set in Section 149 of the Equality Act 2010: a Public Sector Equality Duty. The Public Sector Equality Duty requires us to:

· Eliminate discrimination, harassment and victimisation

· Promote equality of opportunity

· Foster good community relations.

Leicester City Council takes its Public Sector Equality Duty seriously and sets out our approach to meeting that duty in our Equality and Diversity Strategy which is posted on our website.  We also ensure that equalities implications are highlighted in all of our decision making reports in a standard section containing various implications that decision makers must be aware of.  For service changes our officers complete equality impact assessments, again highlighting the potential impacts of decisions on those affected by them as set out in our Public Sector Equality Duty.  Our annual budget report contains a separate section highlighting how we meet our Public Sector Equality Duty in making our budget decisions.

22. Where do the funds come from, and how does Leicester City Council raise the funds to pay its members and employees.

Where our funds come from is explained in our accounts.

23. Where do the funds come from, and how does Leicester City Council raise the funds to pay its, running costs, for all the building that it occupies.

This is explained in our accounts.

24. Does Leicester City Council pay for the use of natural resources, utilities such as water and Electricity. 
Yes.

25. Where may we find a copy of the report published (2014) by Local Government Boundary Commission, in regards to altering Leicester City Boundary
STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS 2014 N.o 3339

A copy of the Local Government Boundary Commission for England’s 2014 report making recommendations for Leicester City’s ward boundaries can be found on the Commission’s website at  http://www.lgbce.org.uk/current-reviews/east-midlands/leicestershire/leicester-fer
26.
Was the local Justice area affected, when Leicester (Electoral Changes) order 2014 came into force, where can we view or obtain a coy of a map which defines the boundary of the local justice area, for Leicester City

No the local justice area namely the Leicestershire Police Force area, was not affected when the Electoral Changes order 2014 came into force.  Details of the Leicestershire Police Force area can be found on their website at https://leics.police.uk/local-policing 

The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Information Governance
City Barrister & Head of Standards
1st Floor
16 New Walk
LEICESTER LE1 6UB 
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.
