Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I wish to submit a request for the actual information we require under the Freedom of Information Act and the Freedom of Information Act for the Environment 2004:

For the years 2011- 2015 we would like Leicester City Council to tell us:

The average volume of traffic, for every hour during every day

The average journey time, for every hour during every day

for each section of the A590, between its junctions with each of the ‘A’ roads, for all motor vehicles, flowing in each direction.
Clarification received 26/05/15:-

Yes, it is indeed, the A594 in Leicester which is the inner ring road.

ANSWER:  
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
In addition I would like to request an outline of what GPS information is supplied to Leicester City Council what analyses Leicester City Council performs upon it and how regularly this is done eg. hourly, daily, weekly etc and to whom the information is reported.
1. We receive extremely large csv files (a sample file containing one month’s worth of data has over 14.5 million records) which contain a Reference Number identifying a link in the road network, the date of the record, the quarter-hour period of that day that the record comes from, the vehicle class (car, LGV, HGV1, HGV2, bus, taxi, motorised caravan. Other or Unknown), data source, number of trips contained in that record, the average journey time in hundredths of a second and the sum of the square of the average journey time.

2. The most common analysis would be a simple mph average using all the data available across neutral months (usually April – June & Sept/Oct of the current year). We might remove school holiday data, especially if the query is specifically school/pupil related. These are done as part of investigations into some (but not all) requests for traffic calming and/or pedestrian crossings.

3. These are done on a project by project basis.

4. The average speed data relating to traffic calming requests are reported to senior officers and executive officers as appropriate. The pedestrian crossing speeds form part of the overall request assessment calculation, and are not reported separately.

I would like to request any reports compiled by Leicester City Council from its analyses of the data.
We do not compile formal reports from the analysis of the Trafficmaster data.

The average speeds in relation to requests for traffic calming are normally presented as a thematic map, and the pedestrian crossings speeds, as mentioned above, are not reported separately at all.

The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Information Governance 

Leicester City Council
1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester, LE1 6UB
E-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.
