Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Youth Homelessness
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Data request for all queries below:

· Age

· 16-17 year olds

· 18-24 year olds

· Years

· 2014

· 2013

· 2012

· Data type

· Numerical totals for each item by age group and year

Query 1: Your Data systems

What software and database systems are used to maintain and query your homelessness data? 
(E.g. Paper-based records, Excel spreadsheet, Locata (Sector UK), Abritas, Capita, Peter Lalley’s Microsoft Access Database)

Answer:

Capita Open Housing including the hummingbird tool
Civica Open Revenues

Excel spreadsheets
Query 2: Homelessness presentations and assessments 

Number of referrals:
a) Presented themselves as homeless, or at risk of homelessness
2014 16-17 year olds 12

2014 18-24 year olds 239

2013 16-17 year olds 9

2013 18-24 year olds 339

We do not have the information for 2012, therefore this is a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the Council.

b) Presented themselves as homeless, or at risk of homelessness
c) Were subsequently assessed under Section 7 of the Children’s Act

d) of b), who’s case was closed after assessment 
e) of b), who’s case remained open and progressed after assessment

f) of b), did any receive any further support around their housing

g) of d), how many were accommodated

h) of d), how many were offered support to maintain current accommodation

i) of d), how many were supported to access accommodation, for example through financial support packages

We do not hold data for this – it was not collected prior to this year.

Query 3: Needs
Number of young people who progressed through Children’s Services under the Children’s Act, after having presented themselves as homeless, or at risk of homelessness (2a above) who fell into the following needs categories: 

a) N1=Abuse or neglect 

b) N2=Child’s disability 

c) N3=Parental illness or disability 

d) N4=Family in acute stress 

e) N5=Family dysfunction 

f) N6=Socially unacceptable behaviour 

g) N7=Low income 

h) N8=Absent parenting 

Query 4: Accommodation/Outcomes

Number of young people who were housed under the Children’s Act in one of the following types of temporary accommodation (please provide either snapshots by quarter or totals for the year):

a) H5=Residential accommodation not subject to children’s homes regulations 

b) K2=Homes and hostels 

i. How many were accommodated with the local authorities’ own stock or with RP/RSLs?

ii. How many received formal support?

c) P1=Placed with own parents or other person with parental responsibility

i. How many received formal support?

d) P2=Independent living, eg in flat, lodgings, bedsit, B&B or with friends, with or without formal support 

i. How many were placed in a B&B?

ii. How many were accommodated with the local authorities’ own stock or with RP/RSLs?

iii. How many were accommodated in the private sector

iv. How many received formal support?

v. How many were ‘sofa surfing’ with friends?

vi. How many of these placements were deemed ‘suitable’?

e) P3=Residential employment 

f) R1=Residential care home 

g) R2=NHS/Health Trust or other establishment providing medical or nursing car

h) R3=Family centre or mother and baby unit 

i) R5=Young Offender Institution or prison 

j) S1=All residential schools, except where dual-registered as a school and children’s home 

k) T0=All types of temporary move 

l) U1-U6= any foster placement 

m) Z1=Other placements 

Query 5: Factors recorded at the end of the assessment

Number young people who presented as homeless or at risk of homelessness and whose case progressed under the Children’s Act, who had one or more of the following factors recorded at the end of the assessment: 

a) 1A           Alcohol misuse: Concerns about alcohol misuse by the child 

b) 1B           Alcohol misuse: Concerns about alcohol misuse by the parent/carer 

c) 1C           Alcohol misuse: Concerns about alcohol misuse by another person living in the household

d) 2A           Drug misuse: Concerns about drug misuse by the child 

e) 2B           Drug misuse: Concerns about drug misuse by the parent/carer 

f) 2C           Drug misuse: Concerns about drug misuse by another person living in the household

g) 3A           Domestic violence: Concerns about the child being the subject of domestic violence

h) 3B           Domestic violence: Concerns about the child’s parent/carer being the subject of domestic violence

i) 3C           Domestic violence: Concerns about another person living in the household being the subject of domestic violence

j) 4A           Mental health: Concerns about the mental health of the child 

k) 4B           Mental health: Concerns about the mental health of the parent/carer 

l) 4C           Mental health: Concerns about the mental health of another person in the family/household

m) 5A           Learning disability: Concerns about the child’s learning disability

n) 5B           Learning disability: Concerns about the parent/carer’s learning disability

o) 5C           Learning disability: Concerns about another person in the family/household’s learning disability

p) 6A           Physical disability or illness: Concerns about a physical disability or illness of the child

q) 6B           Physical disability or illness: Concerns about a physical disability or illness of the parent/carer

r) 6C           Physical disability or illness: Concerns about a physical disability or illness of another person in the family/household

s) 7A           Young carer: Concerns that services may be required or the child’s health or development may be impaired due to their caring responsibilities

Response for Q3 to Q5

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.  We did not collect the requested information prior to this year.
The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Information Governance
City Barrister & Head of Standards
1st Floor
16 New Walk
LEICESTER LE1 6UB 
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.
