Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. Market Position Statement

Please provide a copy of, or a link to, the Local Authorities latest ‘Market Position Statement’ detailing the forward view of the Care Home market and taking into account the Local Authorities obligations under the Care Act 2014 (both Phase 1 and Phase 2).  If this document is still in draft please provide a draft version where possible, should a forward view not be currently available or is under consultation, please submit or provide a link to the latest relevant document and provide a date when the revised or new Care Act compliant ‘Market Position Statement’ will be produced.
The latest published Market Position Statement can be obtained from the following link:

http://www.leicester.gov.uk/media/179251/adult-social-care-market-position-statement-2014.pdf
We are currently working on our ‘Market Position Statement’; and do not have a definitive publication date at this time. Therefore, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held.
2. Care Home Bed Procurement Process 

Please provide the agreed or proposed procurement process for setting or revising fees for the current 2015/16 (if not already set) and 2016/17 financial years onwards.
Leicester City Council (LCC)  undertook a detailed exercise to establish the typical costs of providing residential care across the City for differing levels of support. That process set the methodology and rates payable up to and including 2014/15.

For 2015/16 LCC wrote to Providers in April outlining the proposed uplifts for 2015/16 as part of a consultation exercise. The Council has calculated the proposed uplift based on the same methodology that was used for 2014/15 and which takes into account the most recent movement in the National Minimum Wage, increases to the consumer price index and Bank of England base rate. This exercise is being finalised following the receipt of consultation responses with a view to agreeing the finalised rates for 2015/16.

LCC has not yet determined the approach / methodology as to how it will calculate pay rates for 2016/17. This exercise will commence shortly.

3. Care Act Compliance Requirements 

Please state the information the Local Authority will be requesting from Providers of care home beds in order to fulfil its obligations under the Act and to be ‘Care Act’ compliant by April 2016.  This should include a list of data required from Providers and any critical timelines or dates Providers are expected to provide this information in order for the Local Authority to fulfil its obligations under the Care Act by April 2016.
Leicester City Council is in the process of planning for the changes that will take effect from April 2016, including the introduction of Care Accounts and the Cap on Care Costs. These currently exist only as outline plans and do not cover the detail of what will be requested of care home providers. The detail will be developed more fully following the statement of intent that is due to be published by the Department of Health this month. It is likely that the support of care home providers will be required in the identification of self-funders within homes; the Council can then make progress with assessing their needs prior to April 2016. Assistance may also be requested to support with the dissemination of information to residents and their families to better understand the nature of the changes.

Outside of the above, from April 2015, Section 48 of the Care Act places a duty on a local authority where a registered care provider carrying out a regulated activity becomes unable to carry on that activity because of business failure. A local authority has an interim duty to manage the provider failure and service interruption, ensuring a continuity of care for Service Users. Therefore, a local authority needs to ensure that its local market is sustainable and that it has such contingency plans to be able to discharge this duty.

In order to be confident that there is enough competition and supply in the market to meet demand, local authorities will need to assess the Providers they contract with in terms of their ongoing business viability. One of the key planks in assessing business sustainability is to assess the financial viability of a Provider. For this reason local authorities will need to assess the financial standing of the Providers we are in contract with and as such we will work with Providers on an individual basis to obtain the assurances we seek on the financial standing of the Provider.  

4. Responsible Persons 

Please provide (stating Name, Title and Email address) the person/s responsible for approving all and any recommendations pertaining to fees paid to Providers of Care Homes for 2016/17.

The responsible person is:

Councillor Rory Palmer - Deputy City Mayor and Lead Member for Adult Social Care.  

His address is City Hall, 115 Charles Street, Leicester, LE1 1FZ.

Email contact Rory.Palmer@leicester.gov.uk

5. Key Dates and Timelines

Please provide the key dates that the Local Authority is working toward in order to meet its obligations under the Care Act 2014 up to and including April 2016 for fees that will be applicable for the period 2016/17.  This should include but need not be limited to the key dates as follows:

I. Fee Consultation Process with Providers (pre and post collection of data relating to the fee setting process for 2016/17)

II. Collection of data relating to the fee setting process for 2016/17 (i.e. the Cost of Care breakdown etc.)

III. Evaluation of data relating to the fee setting process for 2016/17

IV. Recommendations to Cabinet and/or relevant persons responsible for approving fee increase decisions for 2016/17 (please state all decision approvers by name and title).

V. Confirmation and Communication dates of 2016/17 fees to Providers to include any further consultation phases

VI. List any other dates by when Providers are required to provide specific information in order for the Local Authority to consider in the calculate of care home bed fees for 2016/17

VII. Other relevant dates and timelines relating to the fee setting process
Leicester City Council has not determined the approach / methodology it will employ to calculate fee rates for 2016/17. A working group will be established to consider this and this will be supported by a consultation process in order to develop the proposals. We will circulate to all Providers and interested stakeholders in due course to advise of the consultation process and invite contributions. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
6. Pay Rate Assumptions 2015/16

Based on the current model fees (for the period 2015/16) please provide the following information (excluding any Employers NI contribution etc. i.e. the actual Pay Rate to the resources themselves:

The hourly pay rate/s to the employee used by the Local Authority when calculating the fees paid to Care Homes for:

I. Carer

II. Senior Carer

III. Nurse (please provide for each Nurse grade)

(If the fees for 2015/16 are not yet set, please provide the latest data relating to the current fees paid)
The fees model uses the national minimum wage as a basis for predicating hourly pay rates for care staffing costs. To note – the model calculates costs for carers and senior carers. We do not pay nursing costs. The following rates apply to the initial model as at 2012/13. These rates have then been subsequently uplifted each year in line with the national minimum wage increase for each year:

I.
Carer - £6.08

II.
Senior Carer - £6.48

7. Pay Rate Assumptions 2016/17

Please expand on your answer to the question above stating how you will calculate or have calculated the 2016/17 hourly pay rates for the above resources.  Please provide the indices used and/or data sources utilised in order to calculate these pay rates.  Where this has not been calculated, please state the methodology to be used to calculate or establish these rates going forward and provide any assumptions made in your formulae around; Employers NI, Overtime, Provision of training etc. if included in the data provided.
Leicester City Council has not determined the approach / methodology as to how it will calculate pay rates for 2016/17. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
8. Auto Enrolment

Please explain and provide any applicable formulae used for current care home fees in respect of calculating the impact of Auto Enrolment on fees paid to Providers.  Please also explain how this is to be incorporated into the 2016/17 fees and state what information you would require from         in order to determine how Auto Enrolment will impact fees paid to Providers going forward for care home beds.
Leicester City Council has not been approached by any of its’ contracted providers to advise the impact of auto-enrolment . The Council will be considering this as part of the 2016/17 approach. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
9. Follow-Up Timeline

If the Local Authority is unable to provide answers to any of the above questions, please provide a date by when and the name of the person responsible for providing information on behalf of the Local Authority in order for        to follow up and request the information at a later date to avoid unnecessary FOI requests being submitted.
Tanya Sheehan. E-mail; Tanya.sheehan@leicester.gov.uk
10. Forums and Associations

In the spirit of partnership and to avoid future FOI requests for information,     would like to consider joining any forums or associations the Local Authority are engaging to further their Care Act obligations.  Please provide the relevant contact details where applicable of the parties or entities the Local Authority will be engaging with to consult on the implementation of the Care Act, specifically in respect of care home bed fees.
Leicester City Council holds a residential and nursing care home provider forum. The forum meets on a quarterly basis. Details of future diarised events are: 10th September & 3rd December 2015. 

11. FOI Point of Contact

Please provide the name, title, email and contact number of the person   should speak to who is responsible at the Local Authority for the provision of this information and to whom        should seek to engage with or clarify any content in response to this FOI going forward.
Lynn Wyeth, Information Governance Manager. E-Mail; info.requests@Leicester.gov.uk
12. Out of Area Placements

Please confirm how you determine the appropriate fee for ‘out of area’ placements paid by your Local Authority.  Please also confirm your approach to annual increases to these fees. 

Leicester City Council undertakes an assessment of need and if it is determined that a person meets the eligibility criteria for Care Services and that those needs can best be met in a care home then the local authority will pay the equivalent of the ‘host’ local authority rate.

The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
First Floor 16 New Walk 
LEICESTER LE1 6UB
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.ico.org.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.
