Freedom of Information Act 2000 – preventing youth homelessness
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Please provide information for the financial year 2014-15 but also note any emerging information you have for this current financial year. Please include details of age ranges where possible.

1. Do you offer services in your area for young people at risk of homelessness due to family breakdown to prevent them from leaving home?

a. Yes

b. No


Yes, if this were an issue for any family on the programme having met the 
Phase 1 Troubled Families criteria

In addition to the above provides an in-house reconciliation/mediation 
service to prevent family breakdown. (See question 5) 
2. If yes, which of the following services do you offer in your area for young people at risk of leaving home due to family breakdown to prevent them from leaving home? (Tick all that apply)

a. Family mediation (
b. Family support (e.g. Troubled Families)
c. Parenting support/programmes (for families with teenagers) 
d. Respite for young people at risk of family breakdown (
e. Other……. (please specify)

3. For each of the service types you have indicated in your answer to question 2, please could you state what the eligibility/ selection criteria are for young people or families seeking access to those services? 

a. Family mediation – Anyone approaching Housing Options for advice and assistance who may be facing homelessness due to family breakdown.  
b. Family support (e.g. Troubled Families): Families who meet two or more of the Troubled Families Phase 1 criteria: worklessness/young person committing a crime; low school attendance or poor behaviour in school.
c. Parenting support/programmes (for families with teenagers): Following assessment any parents where there was a need identified would be referred to a Parenting Programme.
d. Respite for young people at risk of family breakdown:  As part of the Homelessness Strategy we have commissioned 85 units of specialist support for young people facing homelessness (18-25 years old).  This may be used for respite purposes.  
e. Other……. (please specify)

4. Please list the service user outcomes which are measured and recorded across each programme type:

a. Family mediation – Prevention of Homelessness and reported as part of our statutory returns to Government 
b. Family support (e.g. Troubled Families) Reported as part of our statutory returns to Government 

c. Parenting support/programmes (for families with teenagers)

d. Respite for young people at risk of family breakdown.  Outcomes are recorded in relation to posiive /negative ‘move ons’ from accommodation based support to either independent settled accommodation or reuniting with family  
e. Other……. (please specify)

5. In what percentage of cases during the financial year 2014/15 has youth homelessness been avoided due to your services working with families to prevent family breakdown? (Please provide an exact figure if possible, if not please state where estimates are used)


Percentage of Prevention for 16-17 year olds, prevented by resolving family 
breakdown: 13.3% (2 of 15) 


Percentage of Prevention for 18-24 year olds, prevented by resolving family 
breakdown: 4.3% (9 of 211)

6. How much money is allocated from each of the following budgets to fund services for young people at risk of homelessness due to family breakdown to prevent them from leaving home? What percentage of the overall budget does this account for? (Please provide an exact figure if possible, if not please state where estimates are used)

a. Children’s services: This is part of the overall budget for Children’s services.  We do not have a breadkdown of the budget for these specific functions. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

b. Housing: This is part of an overall budget that supports the Homelssness Strategy.  We do not have a breadkdown of the budget for these specific functions. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
c. Early intervention grant: We do not have a breadkdown of the budget for these specific functions. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

d. Troubled Families funding: An attachment fee of £1,600 was awarded for each Troubled Family case worked within 2014/15.  This would fund whole family working to address all family needs including, where relevant, a young person being at risk of homelessness.
e. Social Impact Bonds: We do not have a breadkdown of the budget for these specific functions. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

f. Other………… (please specify)

The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Information Governance
City Barrister & Head of Standards
1st Floor
16 New Walk
LEICESTER LE1 6UB 
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.
