Freedom of Information Act 2000 – payment terms to suppliers 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Please supply me with the details of the standard payment terms your council employs in dealings with its suppliers, contractors and any other party supplying a service or product at a cost to your council.

Answer:
Each supplier/ contractor has their own individual payment terms agreed with the Council. Most of our suppliers / contractors generally are aligned to a standard 30 day payment term. 

Every contract and procurement made by or on behalf of the Council must comply with the Contract Procedure Rules, allowing for terms to be the most economically advantageous to the Council.     

Please also supply the most recent available figures showing, within a 12-month period: 

* The percentage of bills your council settled in 10 days or less; 

* The percentage of bills your council settled in 30 days or less; 

* The percentage of bills your council took more than 30 days to settle. 

As our computer software system anticipates most invoices will be settled within a 30 day period our statistics only draw on this information. The Council does not hold the information as requested above.  Therefore this part of the letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Informaton Act 2000 because in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

However, I am able to confirm the following statistical data, which demonstrates the % value of invoices paid on time. The ‘on time’ is interpreted as 30 days or less. 
	Month
	Value % paid on time

	Aug-14
	81.66%

	Sep-14
	83.25%

	Oct-14
	86.53%

	Nov-14
	91.86%

	Dec-14
	94.26%

	Jan-15
	76.20%

	Feb-15
	91.06%

	Mar-15
	90.01%

	Apr-15
	89.88%

	May-15
	88.92%

	Jun-15
	82.69%

	Jul-15
	86.24%


The remaining percentage took greater than 30 days to settle. 

Please also supply me with the mean average of the amount of time, in days, your council took to settle bills, within the same 12 month period. 
We have due to the volume of data simply addressed the average number of days to process an invoice in 2014-2015, a financial year, which is simpler to extract from our data base. The amount of time in days is 43.88. 

The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Information Governance
Legal Services
1st Floor
16 New Walk
LEICESTER LE1 6UB 
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.
