Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Empty Homes
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. Who deals with all queries related to the Empty Homes?
Carole Thompson
Empty & Decent Homes

Housing

2. For those who work with Empty Homes, what are the name of the staff member(s) and their contact details?
I can confirm that we hold this information. However, we are withholding details of junior members of staff since we consider that to be an absolute exemption under section 40(2) (personal data), and this therefore constitutes a refusal under section 17 of the Freedom of information Act 2000.  
All queries related to empty homes can be sent to the generic email address for action:
 emptyhomes@leicester.gov.uk
3. Do the Empty Homes department need to trace the owners and/or next of kin of these properties?
Yes
4. For those staff member(s) who need to locate the owner and/or next of kin of these properties, what are their names and contact details?
 
See 2 above
5. What steps do the council take in order to locate owners and/or next of kin of these empty properties?
Write to all known addresses
Obtain from Land Registry

Council Tax database

6. How many of these homes are considered "empty homes" due to the fact a public health funeral is taken place?
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

7. How many public health funerals have taken place within the past year? (From January 2015)
A total of 9 Welfare Funerals have been or are in the process of being dealt with since January 2015
8. Of these public health funerals that have occurred, please provide:
a) Name of deceased
b) Date of birth and date of death
c) Last residential address
d) Have the next of kin/family members been traced?
e) What date have the details been referred to the QLTR, Bona Vacantia, Treasury Solicitor, Government Legal Department, NUHU, Duchy or Farrer & Co?
Please see the attached document.

I can confirm that we do have the full address of the deceased, however this letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 31 of the Act is being applied – law enforcement.
Disclosure of the requested information would be likely to have significant negative impact on the prevention of crime. The Council considers there is a strong public interest in avoiding likely prejudice to the prevention of crime.

             

9) Which other organisations have details of the deceased been referred to and why?

None
The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Information Governance
Legal Services
1st Floor
16 New Walk
LEICESTER LE1 6UB 
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.

