

## **BBC Request – Fraudulent Applications.**

Information prior to 2009/10 is not recorded and therefore not available. Therefore, this part of the letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

### **2009/10**

Number of investigations

5 investigations

Reason for investigating

“Incorrect” addresses claiming residence in the priority area

Number of cases found to be outside the rules

3

Number of places withdrawn

2. In addition one parent withdrew their application before our enquiries were completed..

Number and name of schools

4. Overdale, Dovelands, Montrose and King Richard III – all primary schools.

Number of prosecutions

None

### **2010/2011**

Number of investigations

0

### **2011-2012**

Number of investigations

6

Reasons for investigating

“Incorrect” addresses claiming residence in the priority area

Number of cases found to be outside the rules

2

Number of places withdrawn

2

Number and name of schools

2. Rushey Mead School and Soar Valley College – both secondary schools..

Number of prosecutions

None