FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000

Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s
response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

a) the total number of affordable housing units within the local
authority area for each of the following years — 2008/9, 2009/10, 2010/11,
2011/12

New Affordable Housing (Intermediate & Social)
2008/09 — 132
2009/10 — 166
2010/11 - 430
2011/12 -171

b) within the figures for (a), the total number of social rented
housing units for the following years — 2008/9, 2009/10, 2010/11, 2011/12

New SOCIAL housing
2008/09 — 76

2009/10 — 68

2010/11 - 381
2011/12 - 132

C) the number of new-build units approved in the local authority area
in each of the following years — 2008/9, 2009/10, 2010/11, 2011/12

Below is a table setting out total housing approvals by year (monitoring year =
April to March). The data includes conversions and changes of use as well as
new build. It includes approvals with outline and full planning permission. We
have also shown this data with and without self-contained student units. We
would class these as dwellings (as per Government guidance) however we
would exclude them from data on affordable housing as we do not expect
student housing to provide affordable housing.

Total

Self- excluding

All Dwellings | contained student
Approved student flats | units

08/09 | 2841 51 2790
09/10 | 2861 718 2143
10/11 | 6961 1077 5884
11/12 [ 2193 1413 780

d) within the figures for (c), the total number of affordable new-build
housing units approved in the local authority area in each of the
following years — 2008/9, 2009/10, 2010/11, 2011/12



This information is not held by Leicester City Council as we do not monitor
approvals for affordable housing. Therefore, this part of the letter acts as a
refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000
because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, the information is not held.

e) the total number of people currently on the local authority’s social
housing waiting list (please provide the date to which the data is
accurate)

9223 households as at 01/04/2012

f) the average waiting time of people housed by the local authority
in social housing during 2011/12

Average waiting time was 525 days

g) the longest waiting time of any one person housed by the local
authority in social housing during 2011/12

Longest waiting time was 5081 days

h) the average number of people applying to rent social housing
property during 2011/12

Average of 212 applications received per week

i) the maximum number of people who applied to rent a particular
social housing property during 2011/12

A 2 bedroom house attracted the most bids of 266 from all property types in
2011/12

)i the number of pre-existing social rented housing units that
became available for new tenants (e.g. previous tenant moved out)
during 2011/12

2125 social lets (not including HomeCome) for 2011/12 but this includes new
builds as well.

The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own
personal use. Please be aware that any commercial or other use, for example
publication, sale, or redistribution may be a breach of copyright under the
Copyright, Designs and Patents Act 1988 as amended unless you obtain the
copyright holder's prior permission.

Not all the information that is supplied which is covered by copyright will be
the Council's copyright, for example it may be the copyright of a government
department or another Council. You should seek either the Council’'s consent
or their consent as appropriate. The Council is willing to advise you of any
such potential issues on request. In order to make a request to re-use the



information please contact the Information Governance Manager using the
details below.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to:

Information Governance Manager
Information and Support
Leicester City Council

FREEPOST (LE985/33)

New Walk Centre

LEICESTER LE1 6ZG

e-mail: FOIA@Ileicester.gov.uk

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address
within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response. Any such
request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s
absolute discretion.

You can also complain to the Information Commissioner at:

Information Commissioner's Office
Wycliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow SK9 5AF

Telephone: 01625 545 700
www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk

Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally
consider appeals or complaints until the internal appeals and complaints
processes of the public authority which is answering the request have been
exhausted. You are therefore advised to complain or appeal to the
Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.

Yours sincerely
H- M-

Lynn Wyeth
Information Governance Manager



