Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Prevent referrals
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. Between 01.09.24-05.08.25, how many Prevent referrals for people under the age of 18 were made to your local authority's safeguarding/Prevent teams? (Please provide a breakdown of whether the referral was made by a police force, educational institution or other channel. Please also provide the youngest age at which an individual was referred.)

2. Between 01.09.23-31.08.24, how many Prevent referrals for people under the age of 18 were made to your local authority's safeguarding/Prevent teams? (Please provide a breakdown of whether the referral was made by a police force, educational institution or other channel. Please also provide the youngest age at which an individual was referred.) 

3. Between 01.09.22-31.08.23, how many Prevent referrals for people under the age of 18 were made to your local authority's safeguarding/Prevent teams? (Please provide a breakdown of whether the referral was made by a police force, educational institution or other channel. Please also provide the youngest age at which an individual was referred.)  

Answer:

The Local Authority does not hold the requested information as all Prevent referrals are sent to the police. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
Please submit your request to the Police.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
