FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

Please note: If your local authority is not responsible for fly-tipping/illegally dumped waste then I may have contacted you by mistake and I apologise for this error. If this is the case then, to avoid any unnecessary time spent on dealing with this request, a simple “we are not responsible for fly-tipping, it is the responsibility of [insert name of body]” reply by email will suffice.
Please contact me if you have any questions about my request. As required under the FOI Act, please provide any guidance I may require for this request to be dealt with by your local authority.
1)
a. For the last financial year (2020-2021) how many fines or fixed penalty notices did your authority issue for fly-tipping?
64.

b. How many were paid/unpaid?
43 Paid In full / 23 Unpaid

c. What was the total revenue received from these fines or FPNs? (i.e. actually received by your authority)
£10,780.00 Payments received between 01/04/2020 and the 31/03/2021 – Please note, some FPNs for this year may have been paid after 31/03/2021
d. What is the total amount (in £s) unpaid after 30 days?
£3,180.00 of the total amount paid was paid after 30 days total amount remaining unpaid after 30 days = (23 x £400) £9,200.  Please note, FPN’S paid early are at the reduced rate of £280
e. How much was spent on issuing these fines?
This forms part of the job role and is not recorded as a specific cost. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
2)
a. For the last financial year (2020-2021) how many times did your authority prosecute individuals or businesses for fly-tipping?
1 as the courts were then closed due to the pandemic from March 2020 onwards
b. How many resulted in convictions? 
1 successful prosecution but they were not sent to prison.

c. Was any revenue received as compensation?
No.

d. Was any revenue received as costs?
No.

e. How much was spent on these prosecutions?
£900 (£750 + Vat £150)

To instruct Counsel to prosecute the case at the Crown Court.
f. What is the total amount of compensation awarded unpaid?
Nil.

g. What is the total amount of costs awarded unpaid?
Nil
3) For the last financial year (2020-2021) how many cases of fly-tipping did your authority deal with?
9999 incidents of fly tipping were removed.
4) For the last financial year (2020-2021), what was the total cost to your authority of dealing with cleaning up fly-tipping?
£380,214

5) How many people live in your local authority area?
The only accurate data held is the 2011 census.

https://www.leicester.gov.uk/media/177367/2011-census-findings-diversity-and-migration.pdf
6) How many cases of fly-tipping were reported to your authority on private land?
31 incidents of fly tipping were removed from private land. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
