FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. How many SARs (not other types of data protection requests) have been made to the council in the last 12 months?

2. How many SAR requests have gone over a deadline (either the standard 30 day allocation or the extended 90 day allocation for more complicated responses)?
	Month
	Number of SARs
	Number exceeded deadline

	October 2021
	13
	0

	Nov 2021
	13
	0

	Dec 2021
	8
	0

	Jan 2022
	23
	0

	Feb 2022
	22
	0

	March 2022
	17
	0

	April 2022
	19
	0

	May 2022
	14
	0

	June 2022
	17
	0

	July 2022
	21
	0

	August 2022
	23
	1

	September 2022
	17
	0

	October 2022
	19
	0

	Total: 
	226
	1


3. How many staff are usually contacted to provide data to contribute to the request?
The number of staff involved is unique to each request.  If, for example, we received a request for all records relating to a child with SEN needs, several departments would be responsible for gathering the data.  SEN, Social Care, Early Help, Child Psychology, Education Welfare etc. would all need to be approached to collate the relevant information.
Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17(1) of the FOIA because, in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act, this information is not held.
4. On average how many hours are spent dealing with a SAR?
Again, this information is not recorded, the time spent is unique to each request. 

5. Do you have any software to assist with SAR production and if so, which?
Adobe Pro


6. Who has budget responsibility over the costs & resources required to respond to the SARs? Please provide

Name:


Lynn Wyeth
Title:



Head of Information Governance and Risk
Direct Email:

Lynn.Wyeth@leicester.gov.uk
Direct Phone Number:
0116 454 1300
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
