Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information you are requesting.
You asked for:

1. Contract Title:
Answer:
The information you have requested is already available in the public domain. Under section 21 of the FOI Act we are able to show you where to find it. You can find it at Leicester City Council’s website by clicking on the below link.
http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/data-protection-and-foia/transparency-and-open-data
2. Contract Type: Please input one the type of contract from above e.g. Hardware,Maintenance, Virtualisation Licensing, Virtualisation Maintenance/Support, Storage Area Network Maintenance
We proactively publish contract information, as per the above link.  However any information not held in the spreadsheet provided by the link would mean we had to go through each contact individually to provide this information.  There are currently 310 contracts on the list, if we took 5 minutes to look at each contract for the extra information you require it would take in access of 25 hours just for this question.  

The Council does not have to respond to the request under section 12 of the FOI Act if it would take over 18 hours to provide you with the information. Alternatively you could refine your request. Please don’t hesitate to contact us if you need help in doing that.

3.     Existing/Current Supplier:
The information you have requested is already available in the public domain. Under section 21 of the FOI Act we are able to show you where to find it. You can find it at Leicester City Council’s website by clicking on the below link.
http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/data-protection-and-foia/transparency-and-open-data
4.     Hardware Brand:  Please state the hardware or software brand related to the contract with supplier e.g. Hardware Maintenance could be Dell, IBM etc
We proactively publish contract information, as per the above link.  However any information not held in the spreadsheet provided by the link would mean we had to go through each contact individually to provide this information.  There are currently 310 contracts on the list, if we took 5 minutes to look at each contract for the extra information you require it would take in access of 25 hours just for this question.  

The Council does not have to respond to the request under section 12 of the FOI Act if it would take over 18 hours to provide you with the information. Alternatively you could refine your request. Please don’t hesitate to contact us if you need help in doing that.

3. Operating System / Software(Platform): (Windows, Linux, Unix, VMWare etc.) the brand name relating to the contract.
We proactively publish contract information, as per the above link.  However any information not held in the spreadsheet provided by the link would mean we had to go through each contact individually to provide this information.  There are currently 310 contracts on the list, if we took 5 minutes to look at each contract for the extra information you require it would take in access of 25 hours just for this question.  

The Council does not have to respond to the request under section 12 of the FOI Act if it would take over 18 hours to provide you with the information. Alternatively you could refine your request. Please don’t hesitate to contact us if you need help in doing that.

4. Annual Average Spend: (For the whole duration of the contract, if the total value sent is per annum please state this in the response)
The information you have requested is already available in the public domain. Under section 21 of the FOI Act we are able to show you where to find it. You can find it at Leicester City Council’s website by clicking on the below link.
http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/data-protection-and-foia/transparency-and-open-data
7.     Contract Duration: (Please can you also include notes if the contract includes any contract extension periods.)
The information you have requested is already available in the public domain. Under section 21 of the FOI Act we are able to show you where to find it. You can find it at Leicester City Council’s website by clicking on the below link.
http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/data-protection-and-foia/transparency-and-open-data
8.     Contract Expiry Date:
The information you have requested is already available in the public domain. Under section 21 of the FOI Act we are able to show you where to find it. You can find it at Leicester City Council’s website by clicking on the below link.
http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/data-protection-and-foia/transparency-and-open-data
9.     Contract Review Date: (An approximate date of when the organisation is planning to review this particular contract.)
The information you have requested is already available in the public domain. Under section 21 of the FOI Act we are able to show you where to find it. You can find it at Leicester City Council’s website by clicking on the below link.
http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/data-protection-and-foia/transparency-and-open-data
10.  Brief Contract Description: I require a brief description of the service provided under this contract.
The information you have requested is already available in the public domain. Under section 21 of the FOI Act we are able to show you where to find it. You can find it at Leicester City Council’s website by clicking on the below link.
http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/data-protection-and-foia/transparency-and-open-data
11.  Internal Contact: (The person from within the organisation that is responsible for reviewing and renewing this particular contract. Please include there full name, job title, direct contact number and direct email address.)
The internal contact is Carl Skidmore – City Information Officer
Email – carl.skidmore@leicester.gov.uk
Tel – 0116 4541166

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance 
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester  
LE1 6UB
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


