Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
I am writing to request the following information from your department, regarding the seizure of sick/stray dogs.

Please provide the following information for each of the last three years:
ANSWER:  Please find your table below, now completed.
	 
	         2013

(1 Jan to 31 Dec)
	          2014

(1 Jan to 31 Dec)
	          2015

(1 Jan to 31 Aug)

	Which were the top five most seized dog breeds?
	Will take approx. over 50 hours to find this information.
	Will take approx. over 50 hours to find this information.
	Will take approx. over 50 hours to find this information.

	What were the top five dog breeds surrendered to you by their owners?
	LCC dog wardens do not take dogs from owners
	LCC dog wardens do not take dogs from owners
	LCC dog wardens do not take dogs from owners

	Which breeds were the top five most rehomed dog breeds?
	Ownership of LCC Dog Warden Strays is passed to our kennelling provider on 8th day. *  
	Ownership of LCC Dog Warden Strays is passed to our kennelling provider on 8th day. *  
	Ownership of LCC Dog Warden Strays is passed to our kennelling provider on 8th day. *  

	Which were the top five most put to sleep/disposed of dog breeds?
	1. Pit Bull terrier

2. Staffordshire Bull terrier

No other breed type had more than one dog put to sleep.

	1. Pit Bull terrier

2. Staffordshire Bull terrier

No other breed type had more than one dog put to sleep.

	1. Staffordshire bull terrier

2. Jack Russell

3. Lurcher 

No other breed type had more than one dog put to sleep.


We are not able to supply figures for the top 5 breeds collected as strays, this would mean going through approximately 1500 stray dog forms, however we can say that bull breeds are the most prevalent type of dog we pick up.
Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

We estimate it will take over 50 hours to process your request. This is calculated 
                       2 Minutes x 1500 Cases ÷ 60 Minutes = 50 Hours
This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

You may wish to refine your request by narrowing its scope by being more specific about what information you particularly wish to obtain, including any dates or period of time relevant to the information required. We do have a duty to advise and assist you in refining your request under s16 of the Act, so please don’t hesitate to contact us if you need help in refining your request.
* The Dog Warden Service only collects stray dogs and their kennelling provider becomes the owner of any dogs not claimed after 7 clear days. For this reason the Council does not hold information on the top five most rehomed dog breeds.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance 
Leicester City Council
Legal Services

1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester, LE1 6UB
E-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

