Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council does not hold the information requested.

You asked for:
1. How many vacant primary school teacher posts are there currently in your local authority? Please also provide the figure for October 2013 and October 2014.  

2. How many vacant secondary school teacher posts are there currently in your local authority? Please also provide the figure for October 2013 and October 2014.  

3. How many lessons have had to be cancelled because of a lack of teachers so far this academic year, broken down by primary and secondary school? Please also provide these figures for the total academic years 2013/14 and 2014/15. 

4. How many full school days have had to be cancelled because of a lack of teachers so far this academic year, broken down by primary and secondary school? Please also provide these figures for the total academic years 2013/14 and 2014/15.

Answer:
Unfortunately Leicester City Council does not hold this information.  The information you require will be held by the individual schools.
In order to provide assistance we have provided a link below which will take to you a list of Leicester City Schools.  The list also contains contact details.

http://directory.leicester.gov.uk/schools-directory/
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance 
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester  
LE1 6UB
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


