Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked for:
Children and Families Social Services

 1. What percentage of jobs filled by agency staff were advertised as permanent positions by Children and Families Services, in your City Council in the following departments:

-Early Help (pre-birth to 4 years and 5-19 years) -MASH (or equivalent, e.g. PAN) -Child Protection

From

-April 1 2012 to end of March 2013

-April 1 2013 to end of March 2014

-April 1 2014 to end of March 2015
Recruitment records for agency staff are kept for a period of 6 months only. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
2. What is the overall budget for social provision at your City Council and what percentage of that was apportioned to the Children and Families Services Department during the following time periods:

-April 1 2012 to end of March 2013

-April 1 2013 to end of March 2014

-April 1 2014 to end of March 2015
For your information this letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the budget information held by Leicester 

City Council is accessible by other means, the council website. 

Budget Books

http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/performance-and-spending
Statements of Accounts for all required years:

http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/performance-and-spending/statement-of-accounts
3. Workload: What is the average number of cases/children per (a)Individual social worker and (b)Family support worker within Children and Families Services, at your City Council

-April 1 2012 to end of March 2013

-April 1 2013 to end of March 2014

-April 1 2014 to end of March 2015
We work towards an average of 16 – 20 cases per staff member. However, this can vary depending on staff vacancies, staff absence, the experience level of staff (newly qualified social workers) and the complexity of some cases.
4. In relation to Child Protection and Child in Need cases, please indicate the average referral times from the point of referral to being signed off by team managers within these time periods:

-April 1 2012 to end of March 2013

-April 1 2013 to end of March 2014

-April 1 2014 to end of March 2015

From the moment a referral is received by children’s social care there is a plan of action made by a team manager. Within 24 hours each case will have a plan of action regarding the next steps to be taken. In relation to Child Protection Investigations and other urgent matters, ‘actions’ can take place within hours if a case involves the immediate safeguarding of a child. Throughout the life of a case there is management sign off following task/actions completion by social workers until the case is closed to children’s social care

5. Please specify how many days were lost through ill health at your City Council by:

(a) Social workers

(b) Family support workers

Please provide this information broken down per quarter during this time period:

-April 1 2012 to end of March 2013

-April 1 2013 to end of March 2014

-April 1 2014 to end of March 2015

Can you provide a breakdown of this sick leave into the number of staff taking sick leave and their lengths of absence?
The information below relates to Social Workers, we do not have a generic post titled ‘family support worker’ in children’s services so are unable to search our system for absences.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
	 
	2012-13
	2013-14
	2014-15

	 
	Quarter 1
	Q2
	Q3
	Q4
	Quarter 1
	Q2
	Q3
	Q4
	Quarter 1
	Q2
	Q3
	Q4

	Employees absent through sickness at least once
	46
	43
	44
	50
	51
	46
	51
	44
	41
	50
	50
	36

	Working days lost to sickness
	676
	517
	316
	380
	448
	588
	782
	606
	483
	730
	849
	707


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance 
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester  
LE1 6UB
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


