Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked for:
Please could you provide me with the name(s) of the software application(s) (or the name of the company that develops it) used in your organisation for the following functions:

1. Housing & Council Tax Benefit (for example, Capita Academy, Civica IBS/OpenRevenues or Northgate iWorld/Anite/SX3)

Answer:
Civica - Open revenues

2.  Income Management (for example, Capita AIM, Civica ICON or Northgate

PARIS)
Capita 

3. Call Logging (for example, Tiger 20/20, Datatrack Eclipse or BTS

Commsware)
Tiger

4. Waste Management (for example, P&L or Mayrise)
Leicester City Council has a 25 year PFI contract with Biffa, for the collection, treatment and disposal of household waste.  The IT used in the operations is Biffa’s.  This information is not held by Leicester City Council.
5. Workflow (for example, Northgate Anite or Civica Comino, Kofax or OpenText LinkLink)
Open text is used for EDRMS.
6. Waste Collection (for example, Mayrise, Bartec Auto ID)
Leicester City Council has a 25 year PFI contract with Biffa, for the collection, treatment and disposal of household waste.  The IT used in the operations is Biffa’s.  This information is not held by Leicester City Council.
7. Libraries (for example, lorensbergs netloan, Capita TALIS, Insight Media ICAM, Axiell Galaxy or SirsiDynix)
Lorrensburg for Wifi 

Bramble for library System 

DTech for RFID

8. Corporate Asset Management (for example, TechnologyForge, CIPFA IPF or Northgate Codeman)
IT use Provance (through Risual) however most of the systems have asset management as part of their system.
9. Housing Asset Management (for example, Civica/Keystone or Estateman)
Capita’s OpenHousing system, however, Northgate Housing/Northgate Codeman, which is now known as SAM (Strategic Asset Management) is to be going live shortly and will replace Capita’s OpenHousing System.
10. Anti-Virus (for example, Mcafee, Sophos, Symantec or TrendMicro)
Kaspersky (through trustmarque)

11. Data analytics (for example, IBM Cognos, SAP BusinessObjects, Oracle, Tableau or QlikView)
SSRS
12. Productivity (for example, Microsoft Office, Google Docs or OpenOffice)
Software box – Microsoft Enterprise Agreement 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance 
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester  
LE1 6UB
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


