Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council does not hold the information requested.
You asked:
Clarification received 19/10/15:-

Further to my recent FOI request about planning applications where the applicant is an overseas company (see below, attached), I would like to clarify that I am seeking information from the background database used for planning applications. To be clear, I am not requesting information from your online planning portal (which has limited data filtration capability).

Although it is not my responsibility to give instructions on how or where this information can be found, in the interests of transparency and disclosure I would like to offer guidance in this regard.

Your IT or Planning department should have the expertise and ability to be able to filter their background database for only those records mentioning a certain keyword or keywords.

The country/territory of incorporation or registration of an applicant is ordinarily listed in a separate field of data, usually under the heading of 'Address'. 

To that end, I include attached to this email a list 226 countries and territories I would like searched.

I would therefore be grateful if you could write a script and return the requested information in respect of all of these keywords.

If it will incur no additional time or expense, I would also be grateful for this information in respect of the last decade rather than the past three years. Or else as far back as your digital records allow - I am content to leave the final time frame at your discretion.
As per your clarification and list of countries, we did however perform a search which did not bring up any of the countries mentioned.
Original Request:

I would like to request information under FOIA about planning applications where the applicant is an overseas company.

By 'overseas company' I mean anybody corporate either legally incorporated in a foreign country or registered to or providing an address in a foreign country.

I would be especially interested in this information in respect of the three calendar years from January 2012 up until the date my request was lodged. However, I will be grateful for the requested information in respect of a narrower time frame if this would help to make release of the information more manageable for you within cost/time restrictions.

1. Please can you advise me how and where information is stored about applicants for planning permission, in particular the names of any IT databases or paper-based filing systems used and how they can be filtered or searched to reveal applications where the applicant is an overseas company?
ANSWER:  
We do not and have never recorded if the applicant is an ‘overseas company’.
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
2. Please can you tell me how many planning applications have been lodged by an overseas company?
We do not and have never recorded if the applicant is an ‘overseas company’, therefore this is not applicable.

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
3. Please can you provide me with brief details of each planning application, in particular the address of the land/building, the planning reference number, or some other piece of information I can use to look this up myself?
Not applicable
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance 
Leicester City Council
Legal Services

1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester, LE1 6UB
E-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


