FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I am writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to request the following information:

1. Which enforcement agent or agents does your council employ for matters involving council debts?
This letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, the Council Website, and is already in the public domain. 
The information can be found at Open Data Council Tax and Business Rate Recovery — Leicester Open Data
The following teams utilise the services provided by the enforcement contract.

· Revenues & Benefits

· Business Service Centre

· Parking & Moving Traffic 

2. How many court summons have your council issued in the following years: so far in 2023/24; 2022/23; 2021/22; 2020/21; 2019/ 2020; 2018/ 19?
The information for years 2018/19 to 2022/23 can be found at Open Data Council Tax and Business Rate Recovery — Leicester Open Data. As at 25th October 2023 so far, we have issued 20,327 summonses to obtain a liability order for council tax and 1,642 to obtain a liability order for business rates

Nil return for the Business Service Centre & Parking and Traffic. These debts are serviced as court action through County Court.
NEW QUESTION 3: 

How many times have the council referred to enforcement agents for the purpose of debt collection for the following years: so far in 2023/24; 2022/23; 2021/22; 2020/21; 2019/ 2020; 2018/ 19?
	@ 25/10/2023
	2023/24


	2022/23
	2021/22
	2020/21
	2019/20
	2018/19

	 Revenues 
	12,342 CTAX
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	The information for years 2018/19 to 2022/23 can be found at Open Data Council Tax and Business Rate Recovery — Leicester Open Data.



	Sundry Debts
	41
	56
	59
	70
	251
	187

	Parking & Bus lane fines
	4,932
	18,127
	21,114
	11,199
	17,710
	18,834


4. For those who have been visited please provide an anonymised breakdown of demographics in the categories of household income and race of occupants. 
This information is not held. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
5. Has the council carried out any quality impact assessments on debt collection services? If so, would I be able to request access to this document? 
The following documents are attached:

· Enforcement Agent procurement EIA

· Non-Domestic Rates EIA

6. How many complaints have been made to your council due to actions taken by enforcement agents in the following years: so far in 2023/24; 2022/23; 2021/22; 2020/21; 2019/ 2020; 2018/ 19?
We have received 109 formal complaints in relation to actions taken by enforcement agents over the period 2018/19 to 25th October 2023.  
	
	2023/24


	2022/23
	2021/22
	2020/21
	2019/20
	2018/19

	Complaints
	18
	42
	9
	5
	14
	21


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
