Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1) For financial years 2012-13, 2013-14. 2015-15 and 2015-16 to date, what is your annual tonnage of municipal/domestic recyclable waste collected by your collection authorities?
ANSWER:  

It is assumed that what is requested is the amount of household waste collected for recycling. We have presented the amount collected for recycling, separately to the amounts of green waste collected for composting. These figures are presented below. Please note that none of the figures below include the amount of waste that has been collected for reuse.
It should be noted that as part of Leicester City Council’s treatment of residual waste, wastes are also extracted for recycling from the residual waste stream (e.g. organic waste is collected in the residual waste stream but is recovered for recycling in an anaerobic digestion plant).
	
	Tonnes collected for dry recycling
	Tonnes collected for composting

	2012-13
	22431
	2120

	2013-14
	23009
	2452

	2014-15
	23020
	3260

	2015-16 (until 30/9/15)
	11929
	2397


2) In each of those years, a) what percentage of the municipal/domestic waste was successfully recycled and b) what percentage was sent to landfill and c) what percentage was sent for incineration? 

Leicester City Council’s waste data is reported publically in WasteDataFlow. WasteDataFlow provides reports on the percentage of household waste a) recycled, b) composted or digested, c) recovered through incineration, d) landfilled.

These figures represent the percentage successfully recycled or recovered as they take into account household waste recovered from the residual waste stream as well as the contamination rate of dry recyclables collected. 
It should be noted that Leicester City Council’s waste does not send raw household waste for incineration; only residual materials after waste that has been subject to treatment to recover recyclable materials is sent for energy recovery.
	
	82a: Percentage of household waste arisings which have been sent for recycling
	82b – Percentage of household waste sent for composting or anaerobic digestion
	82c – Percentage of household waste used for energy recovery
	82d – Percentage of household waste that is landfilled

	2012-13
	23.92%
	17.55%
	27.36%
	29.36%

	2013-14
	23.12%
	19.93%
	30.21%
	24.86%

	2014-15
	22.52%
	12.09%
	40.82%
	22.59%


Please note that reduction in the percentage of household waste sent for composting or anaerobic digestion in 2014-15 was due largely to a fire at our contractor’s anaerobic digestion facility which interrupted treatment at the site for over 3 months.

Data for 2015-16 to date is not available as the data has not yet been verified.
The Council does not hold data for 2015-16.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
3) Please provide the aggregate figure in each of those years for a) how much municipal/domestic waste was successfully recycled and b) how much was sent to landfill and c) how much for incineration?
It is assumed that the ‘aggregate figures’ requested mean annual tonnages of household waste a) recycled, b) composted or digested, c) recovered through incineration, d) landfilled. These are presented below.
	
	Household waste arising’s which have been sent for recycling

(tonnes)
	Household waste sent for composting or anaerobic digestion (tonnes)
	Household waste used for energy recovery

(tonnes)
	Household waste that is landfilled

(tonnes)

	2012-13
	26,390.72
	19,365.47
	30,192.68
	32,402.24

	2013-14
	25,979.83
	22,402.49
	33,957.70
	27,945.29

	2014-15
	26,140.37
	14,035.02
	47,379.00
	26,220.80


4) Please provide the figure for each of those financial years for the amount of recyclable waste exported out of the authority area.  Please provide the figure broken by a) place it was exported to in the UK b) EU countries and c) countries in the rest of the world.  
All recyclable waste is eventually exported out of the authority area although some wastes may initially be transferred to waste site within the authority area. 

The full dataset showing destinations for each waste stream sent for recycling for the three financial years from 2012 until 2015 is very comprehensive. It can be downloaded from the WasteDataFlow website (see the Primary Reprocessor Report).
Please click on the following link: - http://www.wastedataflow.org/ 

For your information this letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, e.g. as it is already in the public domain. 
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance 
Leicester City Council
Legal Services

1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester, LE1 6UB
E-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

