Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked for:
1. The FACS care levels (Critical, Substantial, Moderate, Low) for which the council funded adult care in 2014/15
Critical & Substantial

2. The number of people who received council-funded adult care under the FACS system during 2014/15
No of people who received Long Term support for the period 1/4/14 to 31/3/15 was 6,300.

Long Term support is defined in the SALT 2014/15 guidance as:

Long Term support encompasses any service or support which is provided with the intention of maintaining quality of life for an individual on an ongoing basis, and which has been allocated on the basis of eligibility criteria / policies (i.e. an assessment of need has taken place) and is subject to regular review. 

Source: SALT 2014/15 – statutory return

3. The number of people who have received council-funded adult care under the Care Act 2014 system so far during 2015/16
For the period 1/4/15 to 30/11/15, 6,114 people have accessed Long Term Support

4. 
Any estimated or projected figure for the total number of people who 
will receive council-funded adult care under the Care Act 2014 system 
during the whole of 2015/16 (ie a full-year forecast)
A forecast for the number of people accessing Long Term Support, based on current activity to date, for 2015/16 would be 6,442 people.

5.
Any estimated or projected figure (including rough figures) for the total 
number of people who will receive (or be eligible for) council-funded 
adult care during 2016/17 under the Care Act 2014 system
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
6.
The council's full-year adult care expenditure for 2014/15


£87.0m

7.
The council's expected full-year adult care expenditure for 2015/16 
(budgeted figure will suffice if need be)

£87.9m
8.
Any estimate the council has for the full-year additional costs it has 
incurred in 2015/16 (relative to 2014/15) due to (a) the Care and Support 
(Eligibility Criteria) Regulations under the Care Act 2014; and (b) the 
provisions of the Care Act 2014 that relate to carers with support needs 
(a combined figure for a and b will suffice if there is no other option)

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a 
refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 
because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is 
not held by Leicester City Council.
9.
Any estimate the council has for the full-year additional costs it will 
incur in 2016/17 (relative to 2014/15 or 2015/16 – please specify which) 
due to (a) the Care and Support (Eligibility Criteria) Regulations under 
the Care Act 2014; and (b) the provisions of the Care Act 2014 that 
relate to carers with support needs (a combined figure for a and b will 
suffice if there is no other option)
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance 
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester  
LE1 6UB
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

