Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked for:
Please disclose under the FOI Act:

1. The number of complaints or allegations you have received, or been notified of, relating to the sexual abuse of a child or children on the premises of a madrassa or mosque in the following calendar years: a) 2012, b) 2013, c) 2014 and d) 2015 so far.  
a) 1

b) 0

c) 2

d) 0

2. For each allegation in question 1, please state:

a) whether it was investigated and if so how,

b) whether the police became involved, 

c) whether there was a full criminal inquiry, 

d) whether there was a prosecution, 

This information is held by Leicestershire Police; FOIA requests can be submitted using the link below:

https://leics.police.uk/about-us/our-departments/professional-standards/freedom/how-obtain-information
This letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
e) the details of any disciplinary action taken against individuals concerned,

f) and if the matter was not pursued, please provide the reasons why and information on the ultimate outcome of each matter. 
The outcome of any disciplinary investigations is not held by the LADO as this is the responsibility of the individual employer. All allegations are investigated, either by the employer or by Social Care and/or the Police depending on if Child Protection concerns are raised. 
The number of complaints or allegations you have received, or been notified of, relating to the physical abuse of a child or children on the premises of a madrassa or mosque in the following calendar years: a) 2012, b) 2013, c) 2014 and d) 2015 so far.  
a) 14
b) 24

c) 2

d) 4

3. For each allegation in question 3, please state:

a) whether it was investigated and if so how,

b) whether the police became involved, 

c) whether there was a full criminal inquiry, 

d) whether there was a prosecution, 
This information is held by Leicestershire Police; FOIA requests can be submitted using the link below:

https://leics.police.uk/about-us/our-departments/professional-standards/freedom/how-obtain-information
This letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
e) the details of any disciplinary action taken against individuals concerned,

f) and if the matter was not pursued, please provide the reasons why and information on the ultimate outcome of each matter.
The outcome of any disciplinary investigations is not held by the LADO as this is the responsibility of the individual employer. All allegations are investigated, either by the employer or by Social Care and/or the Police depending on if Child Protection concerns are raised. 

4. Whether your council has ever been involved in safeguarding awareness work with madrassas and/or mosques in your area and what form that has taken. 
Leicester City Council has completed some very comprehensive work alongside the Police in relation to safeguarding awareness with Madrassah’s and Mosques. The Local Authority commissions and supports the work of the Federation of Muslim Organisation (FMO) to complete safeguarding training, adherence to safeguarding policies and procedures and safer recruitment processes. The FMO works closely with the local community and builds links with Leaders and relevant agencies. This work has resulted in the amount of referrals reducing significantly in the Leicester area.
5. The number of madrassas currently known to be teaching children in your council area. 
 
We are aware of 87 supplementary schools in the Local Authority. However, supplementary schools or Madrassahs do not have to register with the LA. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance 
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester  
LE1 6UB
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

