Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
Please could you answer the following questions on Leicester City Council's PREVENT programme. 

1) What was the total prevent budget for your council between January 2013-December 2015? Please break the figures down per year; Jan 2013 – Dec 2013, Jan 2014 – Dec 2014, Jan 2015 – Dec 2015.
The Council acts as the accountable body for Prevent funding spent in Leicester which is provided from the Home Office. The Council does not hold its own budget for Prevent.
The Council does not hold this information, therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
2) Please breakdown the budget listing which public bodies provided funding for the council's PREVENT activities/programme, when they provided it, the amount of funding provided and what it was used for.
Not applicable

3) Please provide a breakdown of all organisations in your borough which received funding through the Prevent budget between January 2013 – December 2015. Please detail: 1) names of organisations; 2) the amount of funding received per annum 3) the main objective of the funding.

We are withholding the information under exemptions s24(1), 31(1)(a) (national security and law enforcement respectively) for funding, and s24(1), 31(1)(a) and 38(1)(b) (national security, law enforcement and health and safety) for organisations. Releasing this information may allow third parties to compare the activity levels of the Prevent programme in different parts of the UK. This may facilitate the identification of intelligence regarding the areas of the UK where the threat to national security has been and is considered to be the greatest.
4) What was the total number of channel referrals per annum for the period January 2013 – December 2015? Can you break down the number of referrals by age range; under 12, 13-19, 20-26, 26 and above? Please detail the number of cases in which a family, including a child, has been referred.  

5) If you have any information relating to the reason, concern or activity that the child was referred for please include a breakdown of these. 

6) How many of these referrals have come from the education sector (school teacher)? Please break down per annum for the period January 2013 – December 2015.  Please break down the school referrals by age (0-9, 9-13, 13-18)

7) How many Channel interventions were there in your borough between January 2013 – December 2015? Please provide a yearly breakdown. 

8) Please detail which bodies were involved in these interventions and what was their purpose? 

For questions 4-8 the Council does not hold this information, therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance 
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester  
LE1 6UB
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


