Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked for:
1. Can the local authority confirm the number of applications received for local welfare assistance in the following years: 2012/13, 2013/14, 2014/15.
2013/14 we received 2,227 applications were received

2014/15 we received 1,489 applications were received
We cannot provide data for 2012/13 as the scheme came into operation in April 2013

2. Can the local authority confirm the number of care leavers who applied for local welfare assistance in 2012/13, 2013/14, 2014/15.
For 2013/14 – 25 applications were received from Care Leavers

And for 2014/15 – 20 applications were received

We cannot provide information for 2012/13 as the scheme came into operation in April 2013

3. Does your local authority commission services to support care leavers with managing their money?  
Yes
If yes please could you outline what this service consists of? 
Support and learning re Independent living skills is delivered a number of ways either through workshops or a 1:1 service.  This is dependent upon which organization/agency is working on this.  We have a commissioned course that deals with independent living skills (all aspects of this) and is a 12 week (group taught) course.  We also have services commissioned via the housing department for supported accommodation and this resource delivers support on a 1:1 basis.

See below.


Please tick the following if they are included in your service offer:

a. Free budgeting workshops Yes
b. Workshops offering support on household bills Yes
c. Workshop on advice agencies and accessing independent advice Yes
d. 1:1 budgeting support Yes
e. 1:1 support on household bills Yes
f. 1:1 support on advice agencies and accessing independent advice Yes
g. Free advice on saving and investing money Yes (saving) No (investing)
h. Other (please state)

4. How many care leavers in each of the following years have fallen into debt, where this know to the local authority (2012/13, 2013/14, 2014/15).
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
5. How many care leavers in each of the following years have fallen into debt on their council tax where this is known to the local authority: (2012/13, 2013/14 and 2014/15). 
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
A care leaver may or may not provide social services with up to date information such as their current address.  This makes it difficult to verify if a young person may have fallen into arrears with their council tax  particularly if the young person chose not to tell the staff involved.  
6. How many care leavers up until the age of 25 have been evicted from their accommodation due to falling into arrears in the following years? (2014/15, 2013/14, 2012/13)

In 2012/13 financial year, (April to March), there were 13 tenants under 25 
years evicted for rent arrears. In 2013/14, there were 11, and in 2014/15 
there were 32. We are unable to say how many, if any, of these young 
people 
were care leavers.

A care leaver may or may not provide social services with up to date 
information such as their current address.  This makes it difficult to verify if 
any of those evicted were care leavers particularly if the young person chose 
not to tell the housing staff involved.  
7. How many unaccompanied asylum seeking children (UASC) are in the care of the local authority?
11
8. How many former UASC are receiving leaving care services in this local authority, and of these how many are appeal rights exhausted?

12 Appeal Rights Exhausted, 1 ARE in 2015 

9. In the last three financial years (2012/13, 2013/14 and 2014/15), how many appeal rights exhausted asylum seeking care leavers under 21 years (or 25 years if in full time education) were discharged from Local Authority services?

0

10. How many of the young people referred to in the question above had their leaving care support terminated as a result of a human rights assessment by each financial year (2012/13, 2013/14 and 2014/15)?

0 - We have had one case in the last 3 years where a young person became 
ARE and a Human Rights Assessment was completed. However the young 
person has subsequently gone missing and as yet the case has not been 
closed to 16+ but no current services are in place. 
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance 
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester  
LE1 6UB
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

.


