Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered.  The Council holds the information requested.
You asked for:

1. The prices paid by the authority to independent and voluntary sector homecare providers for the provision of regulated social care services delivered to people aged 65 years or above in their own home, over a ‘reference period’ of Monday 21st to Sunday 27th September 2015, inclusive. Guidance on interpretation of items (a) to (d) is provided in Annex 1, below. Prices paid should be expressed in pounds and pence per hour: 

(a) The lowest rate per hour paid to any individual provider; £12.01
(b) The highest rate per hour paid to any individual provider; £13.21

(c) The average (“arithmetic mean”) price per hour paid to all providers for all hours of homecare services purchased; £12.71

(d) The total hours of care purchased from all providers during the reference period. 18,955 domiciliary care hours.
2. Any statement that the authority may wish to provide to qualify or clarify the figures returned in response to any of the items in question 1. 

As part of the Council’s procurement exercise in 2013, providers were required to complete individual pricing submissions. These submissions set out the provider’s expected costs in relation to staffing costs and operating overheads. Leicester City Council resolves to review the per hour rate of each provider and apply any increase in April of each year. The review requires the Council to uplift staffing costs by the % increase in the national minimum wage. The Council may also decide to increase operating overheads relative to inflation as measured by CPI. The average increase in 2015 was 2.2%. The Council is currently reviewing hourly rates for the next operating year and is considering the implications of the National Living Wage.

3. Evidence that the council has undertaken a cost of care exercise with local independent and voluntary sector homecare providers to assess hourly prices that the council should pay on or after the introduction of the National Living Wage in April 2016, including how this rate was calculated. For the avoidance of doubt, we are asking the authority to evidence the calculation of rates which meet the requirements of paragraph 4.31 of the Statutory Guidance to the Care Act 2014. This requires councils to set fee levels which enable services that will “…promote the wellbeing of people who receive care and support, and allow for the service provider ability to meet statutory obligations to pay at least the national minimum wage and provide effective training and development of staff…”

As a Council we are still in the process of evaluating the impact of the National Living wage and, therefore are not in a position to share any details relating to calculations at this time as this is information not held. This letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
4. In relation to the “Council tax precept for social care” announced by Treasury in the Chancellor’s Autumn Statement 2015:

(a) Copies of any advice prepared by the council’s executive officers and provided to the council’s cabinet making recommendations on whether the council should (or should not) levy the council tax precept; 

(b) The date when any such report was discussed by the council’s cabinet, and the action(s) decided upon; or 

(c) The date when any such report is proposed to be discussed by cabinet. 

A draft budget report will be published on 12th January, and available on the Council’s website. The Mayor will make a formal recommendation to the Council in mid-February. This information is therefore exempt from release under section 22 – for future publication and section 36 – Prejudice to effective conduct of public affairs. Disclosure would, or would be likely to inhibit the ability of public authority staff and others to express themselves openly, honestly and completely, or to explore extreme options, when providing advice or giving their views as part of the process of deliberation. The disclosure of internal discussions would inhibit free and frank discussions in the future, and that the loss of frankness and candour would damage the quality of advice and deliberation and lead to poorer decision making. A chilling effect would occur with officers unwilling to undergo such discussions, or to record them, in future.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
1st Floor

16 New Walk
Leicester 
LE1 6UB
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


