Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Housing
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked for:
1.
How many housing complaints did the council receive?

Answer: 
	2012-13
	2013-14
	2014-15

	1,911
	1,936
	1,655


2.
How many of these complaints were regarding properties owned or run by private companies or housing associations by council tenants? If logged can you provide the complaint log and which companies/providers they were about?

The Council does not record this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

3.
How much did the council pay private companies and landlords to provide housing provision? Can this number be provided for the past 3 years.

01 April 2012 – 31 March 2013 - £46,000

01 April 2013 – 31 March 2014 - £22,700

01 April 2014 – 31 March 2015 - £8,600

4.
How many people in temporary accommodation have made complaints?

The Council does not record this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

5.
How many new residential units approved by the council were built in the borough in 2015? 

In 2014/15, 957 (of which 342 were student accommodation) 

6.
What is the borough’s target for affordable homes?

The Core Strategy adopted in 2010 has an overall affordable housing target for the City for 2006-2026 of 4,065 dwellings.  

7.
How many people in the borough did the council class as ‘intentionally homeless?’ Could these numbers be provided for the past three years - if possible with a monthly breakdown.  

	 Quarter:
	Eligible, homeless and in priority need, but intentionally so:

	Q4 2012-13
	16

	Q1 2013-14
	12

	Q2 2013-14
	10

	Q3 2013-14
	8

	Q4 2013-14
	7

	Q1 2014-15
	8

	Q2 2014-15
	11

	Q3 2014-15
	18

	Q4 2014-15
	17

	Q1 2015-16
	13

	Q2 2015-16
	12

	Q3 2015-16
	6


8.
How many people appealed voluntary homelessness decision by asking for a review of the council’s decision? Could these numbers be provided for the past three years - if possible with a monthly breakdown. 

	 
	Appeals against Intentionally homeless decisions:

	Q4 2012-13
	7

	Q1 2013-14
	5

	Q2 2013-14
	4

	Q3 2013-14
	1

	Q4 2013-14
	6

	Q1 2014-15
	2

	Q2 2014-15
	2

	Q3 2014-15
	8

	Q4 2014-15
	3

	Q1 2015-16
	5

	Q2 2015-16
	7

	Q3 2015-16
	3


9.
How many housing developments are expected to be completed in 2016 and how many involved a renegotiation on the number of affordable housing units?
Approximately 20 large (10 or more dwellings) housing developments will be completed in 2016.  None of these involved a renegotiation of affordable housing numbers. 

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance 
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester 
LE1 6UB
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

