Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked for:
This request concerns implementation of the 0 to 25 special needs (SEN) system. Its objective is to gather data from multiple agencies involved in coordinating and commissioning SEN services to understand relative progress being made towards achieving the reforms set out in the Children & Families Act 2014.

Education Health and Care plans: The following requested data items concern Education Health and Care plans (EHCPs), and each time is requested on a monthly basis for the for the last 12-month period for which data is available, unless otherwise stated,

1. For each month, the total number of individuals identified as being being in need of additional SEN support, broken down by the following categories, 
1. The number of individuals in currently in receipt on an ECHP, during the specified month,

2. The number of individuals currently in receipt of a Statement of special education needs and learning difficulty, during the specified month,

3. The number of individuals currently receiving support as a result of a Learning Disability of Assessment (LDA), but through neither an ECHP or Statement of specific education needs and learning difficulty,  

2. The number of ECHPs issued, broken down by the following categories, 
1. The total number of ECHPs issued,

2. The number of ECHPs issued to individuals who have previously been in receipt of support as a result of an LDA,

3. The number of ECHPs issued to individuals who had previously been issued with a Statement of special educational needs and learning difficulty,

4. The number of individuals issued with an ECHP broken down by the following age categories, where the relevant age is that of individual on the date at which their ECHP was issued,  

1. 0 – 4 year olds, inclusive,

2. 5 – 15 year olds, inclusive,

3. 16 – 18 year olds, inclusive,

4. 19 – 25 year olds, inclusive,

Please find the relevant information attached.

3. The proportion of individuals who have previously received support as result of an LDA assessment and who requested an ECHP have been issued with one, 
1. Over the past 6-month period, the average time between request of an ECHP by individuals who had previously been in receipt of support as a result of an LDA and the point of ECHP issuance,
266 days

2. The number of individuals who have requested an ECHP and who are currently in receipt of support as a result of an LDA have not yet been issued with an ECHP,
65

4. A copy of your most recent ECHP template,
Please find attached.

Local offer and Personal budgets: The following request concern the support and services individuals with SEN are able to access in the region,

1. The three most recent versions of your Local Offer, or greatest number where 3 iterations have not been completed (i.e. document covering the support available to those with and without ECHPs from birth to 25 years, including SEN support),
Please find the Local Offer attached, we have not kept earlier iterations and therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
2. The three most recent versions of your Personal Budgets Offer, or greatest number where 3 iterations have not been completed,
Please attached our Personal Budget Offer, again, we have not kept earlier iterations of this, therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
3. Concerning those in receipt of a Personal Budget, the following data items are requested in relation to the last 12-month period, broken down by month where possible, 

1. The number of individuals who were in receipt of a Personal Budget,
70

2. The average amount in GBP (per annum, or preferred recording period) of Personal Budgets awarded during the specified month,
We do not hold an average cost figures, therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
Additional Early Years Education support: The following requests concern the extent to which the authority is meeting its statutory requirement to extend Early Years Education funding to 2 year olds with SEN needs,

1. Proportion and absolute number of 2 year olds currently with an EHCP or Statement of specific education needs and learning difficulty.


0% - 0
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance 
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester  
LE1 6UB
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


