Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Right to Buy
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council does not hold the information requested.

You asked:
We would like below information under FOI to help us in making decision for RTB council property application as a council tenant.

In last 12 years:

1) How many LCC properties were sold under RTB scheme in the St. Mathews area. Please provide how much RTB discount was applied and market value for each of the property sold after discounting RTB. Please provide how much annual service charge was paid for such sold properties. Was service charge paid higher than estimated?

In last 12 years:

2) How many properties were sold under RTB scheme in the block of flats in 125 to 147 Wharf Street North? Please provide house/flat number of sold property. Please provide how much RTB discount was applied and sold market value for each of the property after discounting RTB. Please provide how much annual service charge is paid for such sold properties. Was service charge paid higher than estimated?

In last 12 years:

3) How many properties sold under RTB scheme were sold/returned back to LCC?

In last 12 years:

4) Average cost of service charge applied and collected by LCC for properties sold under RTB scheme in St. Mathews area?

In last 12 years:

5) What was the variance/difference of service charge estimated and collected each year for sold properties under RTB scheme In St. Mathews area.

Answer:
The data you have requested is excessive. Leicester City Council holds information for no longer than is absolutely necessary. Thus, we do not hold the data you have requested for the past 12 years. 

We retain data for specified purposes that are considered adequate, relevant and not excessive. We therefore, do not hold the data by Specific Street or districts / area as you have requested.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

What Leicester City Council can detail is the number of sales last year and in this current financial year; with the average discount and sale price. In addition we have quoted the average service charge, excluding any contributions for repairs or planned maintenance.  

We would respectfully point out that Right to Buy applicants ‘discounts’ can vary depending upon the market value of their home and the time spent as a public sector tenant. 

We would therefore recommend that you seek independent financial advice to help you decide whether buying your home is the best option for you.

	Year
	Number of Sales 
	Average Discount
	Average Sale Price
	Average Service Charge

	2014 - 2015
	206
	£38,086
	£41,983
	£821.44

	2015 - to 31/12/2015
	172 
	£40,513
	£39,869
	£836.48


Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

Your original request as earlier described is excessive and therefore we cannot comply, or in fact do not hold the extent of the data you have requested.  

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

We do hope that given the information we have provided that it will not be necessary for you to refine your request by narrowing its scope or by being more specific about what information you particularly wish to obtain, including any dates or period of time relevant to the information required. We do have a duty to advise and assist you in refining your request under s16 of the Act so please don’t hesitate to contact us if you need help in further refining your request.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance 
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester 
LE1 6UB
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

