Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
I'm aware that you are currently undertaking a review of Cultural festival events. 
ANSWER:  

Our festivals review recommendations are now published on Leicester City Council’s website and the deadline for comments is 20 April. It can be downloaded here:   https://consultations.leicester.gov.uk/city-development-and-neighbourhoods/festivals-review/consultation/intro/view
For your information this letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, e.g. the Council Website. 

The review stated that festive decorations and related activities provided by the council are excluded from the review, along with one-off events, other activities that are funded through a different process, events delivered by other council teams etc. However I would like a breakdown of what these activities are and the costs associated with these activities. It was stated these costs were taken into account however no figures ware stated. It will enable for a more complete and informed feedback
Here is the extract from the report which relates to your question: 

2.1.2. Activities excluded from the review

· “One-off” events (financial decisions for these are made on a one-off basis).

· Any other activities where financial decisions are approved by the council through any other processes.

· All festive decorations and related activities provided by the council for festivals. (NB the cost to the council of providing these was taken into account in considering each festival, but they were not in themselves reviewed). 

· All festivals and events funded or delivered by council teams other than the festivals and events team. These include for instance, Leicester Business Festival, or events at de Montfort Hall, museums, libraries and Leicester Market.

· Only the specific activities being funded were reviewed and not the organisations delivering each festival. This is because the council’s festivals funding programme does not extend to the year-round operational costs of the organisations concerned. 

2.1.3. Review principles

The level of funding for each activity under review was considered, and the extent to which it represents good value for money for the Council, from the following perspectives:

1.         Economic benefits to Leicester citizens

2.         Social benefits to Leicester citizens

3.         Affordability for Leicester City Council

4.         Efficiency and effectiveness in delivery of the activity

5.         Alignment with Leicester City Council’s aims and objectives

In addition, the following policy on funding for religious events was taken into account. This was set out to the Heritage, Culture, Leisure and Sport Scrutiny Commission on 1 July 2013:

Leicester City Council generally supports festivals that are primarily cultural activities, rather than primarily acts of religious worship or confirmation of religious identity. It may also support the cultural components of primarily religious festivals, where appropriate, but reserves the right to make decisions on these on a “case by case” basis.

During the review it became clear that the economic and social benefits to Leicester citizens are greatest:

· Where the festival is intended to attract people from across the whole city, and beyond the local area.

· Where the festival is not targeted at one specific group, but is as accessible as possible to all Leicester citizens, given the nature of the activity.

These factors were borne in mind in making recommendations.

___________________________________________

It is also important to note that whilst we recognise the importance of valuing all Leicester’s different cultural communities, the budgets for the festivals that we deliver and fund are not divided up strictly in proportion to Leicester’s demographic profile.  Many other factors come into play, as indicated by 2.1.3 above.

In your question you say “It was stated these costs were taken into account”. Please note that the phrase “These factors were borne in mind in making recommendations.” relates in general only to para 2.1.3 not 2.1.2. 

Costs of festive decorations and lighting 

The only exception to this is the cost of festive decorations, which appears in para 2.1.2. “All festive decorations and related activities provided by the council for festivals. (NB the cost to the council of providing these was taken into account in considering each festival, but they were not in themselves reviewed).” 

The reason for this is that the purpose of the review was only to consider budgets relating to the festivals and events section. The festive decorations are funded by the Highways budget

Over and above the figures below, where additional festive decorations or street dressing is provided, e.g. bunting for St Georges Festival, it is generally paid for from the Festivals budgets.

	2015/16 Revenue Budget 
	

	Vaisakhi Festive Decorations
	12,000 

	Eid Festive Decorations
	14,000 

	Diwali Festive Decorations*
	35,000 

	Christmas Festive Decorations**
	170,000 

	Chanukah Festive Decorations
	1,200 

	Caribbean Carnival Festive Decorations
	2,000 

	 
	234,200 


	2015/16 Capital Budget (One-off spend)
	

	Replacement of old Christmas Festive Decorations
	50,000 

	Extension of Diwali decorations 2014/15/16 following demolition of Belgrave flyover*.
	125,000

	 
	175,000 


*The Diwali lights on Belgrave Road are converted to Christmas lights with the substitution of Christmas symbols straight after Diwali finishes and a continuation through to the Christmas period.

** The Christmas festive decorations include the two tableaux from children’s literature and crib on Town Hall Square plus the clock tower Christmas tree.
Activities excluded from the review
We have provided below some further information about the activities excluded from the review, but we cannot provide a full financial breakdown of the other items, because the scope of all these activities is so extensive that the work involved in identifying the information you have asked for would take us over the 18 hours limit.

· “One-off” events (financial decisions for these are made on a one-off basis). These include for example the Queen’s diamond Jubilee and royal visit (2012) The Olympic Torch relay (2012) the Leicester City Football Club homecoming bus tour (2014) the reinternment of King Richard III (2015), the Leicester Rugby World Cup games cultural programme (2015) No budgets have currently been approved for one-off events in the future, because we do not know what these will be. 
· Any other activities where financial decisions are approved by the council through any other processes. We do not know what these might be- this is why they are excluded. This review only considers the elements of council spend relating to the regular programme of the council’s festivals and events team.

· All festive decorations and related activities provided by the council for festivals. (NB the cost to the council of providing these was taken into account in considering each festival, but they were not in themselves reviewed). The financial breakdown for these is provided above.

· All festivals and events funded or delivered by council teams other than the festivals and events team. These include for instance, Leicester Business Festival, or events at De Montfort Hall, museums, libraries and Leicester Market. This review did not consider these, it was not the purpose of the review to look at council spend as a whole; only spend from festivals and events budgets. 

· Only the specific activities being funded were reviewed and not the organisations delivering each festival. This is because the council’s festivals funding programme does not extend to the year-round operational costs of the organisations concerned. This is self-explanatory. Money allocated is for specific festivals only, not for the year round running costs of organisations delivering them.

The Council does not hold some of this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
Further to my previous request is it also possible to get a breakdown/list of what events have been turned down for funding in the last 12 months, be it through this channel, 'one off' or through a different department
 It is not possible to provide this information, the work involved in identifying the information you have asked for would take us more than 18 hours to provide.
Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

You may wish to refine your request by narrowing its scope by being more specific about what information you particularly wish to obtain, including any dates or period of time relevant to the information required. We do have a duty to advise and assist you in refining your request under s16 of the Act, so please don’t hesitate to contact us if you need help in refining your request.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance 
Leicester City Council
Legal Services

1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester, LE1 6UB
E-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

