Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. Has there ever been traffic speed monitoring on Bloomfield Road, Coppinger Road, Heathcott Road, Grampian Close, Cheviot Road or Cairngorm Close?
ANSWER:  Yes, speed surveys have been carried out on Whittier Road, Copinger Road, Bloomfield Road and Heathcott Road.
2. If there has, when was this carried out?
Thursday 11th June 2015.

3. If there has, what percentage of drivers were deemed to be over the legal speed limit (30 mph)?
The results show the number of vehicles travelling at particular speeds. For Whittier Road the percentage over 30 mph was 13%, for Copinger Rd 7%, for Bloomfield Rd 17% and for Heathcote Rd 2%.

If there has not been any speed monitoring on those roads why has it not been carried out before proposed speed cushions were proposed?
Please see answers above.

4. In relation to the planned speed cushions have any alternatives been considered i.e. narrowing as in Cort Crescent?
Yes, a number of other options for reducing speed, such as narrowing, vehicle activated signs, refuges and full width road humps, have been considered in the design process. The proposals are considered to be the most appropriate for this location.
5. Have any councillors in the area raised concerns about speed cushions or other raised modifications that cars will have to travel over?
The ward councillors have been consulted on the proposals and have not raised any concerns at this stage.

6. If they have, which councillors and where is this recorded?
Not applicable

7. If they haven't, why not, when this was raised in the original consultation regarding the new houses on Heathcott Road?
Please see answer for Q5. 

We cannot comment for the Councillors. The Freedom of Information Act states requests under the Act should be made about recorded information and you have not asked for anything we have recorded.
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

8. How has Due Regard been considered and documented considering that localhealth.org.uk states that Freemen Ward (there are no statistics available for the new Saffron Ward) has 17.8% of people with Long Tern Illness or Disability and 6.5% with General Health Bad or Very Bad, the latter significantly worse than England average. (Many of these come with pain which by personal experience is aggravated by raised speed bumps and speed cushions). 
Residents are currently being consulted on the proposals and are encouraged to make comments relating to their concerns, such as the concerns you are referring to, relating to any aspects of the proposals. Residents feedback will be considered during the detailed design stage of the scheme and will be reported to the City Mayor for consideration during the decision making process.

9. People living in these roads will not have any alternative route other than over these obstacles, how has this been considered in relation to damage to vehicles, particularly those that have modifications to them to make them accessible for people with disabilities, which can lower the ground clearance these vehicles have?
The proposals include the use of standard specification items that are used in many roads around the country and as such should not cause any issues. However, residents are currently being consulted on the proposals and are encouraged to make comments relating to their concerns, such as the concerns you are referring to, relating to any aspects of the proposals. Residents feedback will be considered during the detailed design stage of the scheme and will be reported to the City Mayor for consideration during the decision making process. 

10. What happens if a car is damaged by speed bumps/cushions?
The proposals include the use of standard specification items that are used in many roads around the country and as such should not cause any issues if vehicles are driven appropriately.

11. Please supply copies of any documents relating to these issues or evidence of the issues being raised in meetings.

No documents have been created.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance 
Leicester City Council
Legal Services

1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester, LE1 6UB
E-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


