Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked for:
1. Please list all the children's homes in your region, whether they are public or privately owned, and the name of the provider.
We have 5 local authority homes.  We are not able to confirm the number of independent care homes in the city or provider details, this is not information held by Leicester City Council. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held.
2. For each children's home, please indicate how many children are in that home's care as of the current date (08/02/2016).
Local Authority Homes:

· Home A: Short breaks home that look after 1 young person on a shared care basis & 30+ young people on short breaks (respite care)

· Home B: 5 young people

· Home C: 5 young people

· Home D: 6 young people

· Home E: 4 young people

We do not hold information regarding any independent homes in the city. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
3. For each children's home, please provide a contract and tender document.
Please find attached a template contract, this would be used if we were procuring an external placement.  

4. If the amount paid for the services of the children's home cannot be found in the relevant contract, please notify the amount of money paid for those services per financial year.
Costs for external homes can range from £2.8k to £6.5k per week according to the needs of the young people.

5. Could you also provide an organisational chart for your social services department.

Please find the relevant information attached.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance 
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester  
LE1 6UB
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


