Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked for:
The average weekly cost in the local authority for

a) a part-time (25 hours) nursery place for a child under 2

b) a part-time (25 hours) nursery place for a child aged 2 or over
We do not record costs based on the age of a child.  The average cost for a PVI nursery placement (private, voluntary and independent) in the city is £94.
c) part-time (25 hours) childcare with a childminder for a child under 2

d) part-time (25 hours) childcare with a childminder aged 2 or over
We do not record costs based on the age of a child. The average cost for a placement with a childminder is £94.
I would like this data for the current financial year and for 2009/10 

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance 
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester  
LE1 6UB
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

