Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Digital Strategy, Cloud and Office 365 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the following information. 

You asked:

1. What are the main drivers for the Council Digital Strategy? Please rank in order of priority one to five (where one is the most important and five least important).
	Business Drivers
	Council Response

	Financial Constraints and Budgetary pressures 
	

	Delivering Better or Improved Outcomes
	

	Business Transformation Goals
	

	New Ways of working
	

	Meeting Customer expectations
	

	Central Government Policy  and Legislation
	 

	Other, please state
	 


The Council does not hold this information.  This question is asking for an opinion rather than for the release of information held.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

2. Does the Council's Digital Strategy state clearly desired goal to use more Cloud based applications and services?
Answer: Yes

2.1   If no to question 2, what is stopping the adoption of Cloud application and services? 

Not applicable
3. Do you have a Microsoft Enterprise Agreement (EA) that includes Azure and Office 365 Rights to Use?  

Yes

4. When does this Enterprise Agreement (EA) expire,   
February 2019
what is the annual contract value   
650K 
and how many users are licensed?  
5,025
5. Does the Council have plans to migrate infrastructure and applications to the Microsoft Azure Cloud within the next twelve months?

No 

6. Does the Council use Microsoft SharePoint for Electronic Document and Records Management (EDRM) system to manage items such as electronic documents, emails and paper records within the Council? 

No 

6.1   If yes to question 6, what version of Microsoft SharePoint is being used and does the Council have plans to adopt Office 365 SharePoint Online in the next 12 months?

No applicable
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to:
Information Governance 
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester
LE1 6UB
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

