Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Built Legacy Project  
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the following information. 

You asked:

1. How many Listed Building Consent applications for adaptation or demolition were validated in 2015?

Answer: There were 54 listed building consent applications in 2015. Reference numbers for the cases are included in the attached spreadsheet, with the two cases involving demolition in red text.  Using the attached reference numbers you can search the applications online for answers to your supplementary questions: http://rcweb.leicester.gov.uk/planning/onlinequery/mainsearch.aspx 

Therefore this letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, e.g. the Council Website, as it is already in the public domain.  


2. Of these, how many times did the submission include a Heritage Statement or Heritage Impact Assessment?

As above

3. How many times did a planning officer or specialist advisor (e.g. conservation officer, heritage officer, historic environment advisor) request supplementary information to inform consent such as a Historic Building Survey and Report in 2015?

This information is not recorded.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

4. How many times did Planning or Listed Building Consent include a condition for Historic Building Recording to be carried out in 2015?

See attached spreadsheet

5. How many times was a requirement to archive digital data included with a request for historic building or structure recording in 2015?

There are currently no building surveys recorded on the Historic Environment Record (HER) that took place between 01/01/2015 and 31/12/2015.  This record may change as further reports are completed and submitted to the HER by external archaeological contracting units, for example the survey of the gas holders on Aylestone Road that was carried out in November 2015 (the report is still outstanding).


6. How do you ensure that historic building information submitted as part of the Planning or Listed Building Consent process is accessible to the public in the long term?

Where a building survey or assessment is required to satisfy an archaeological condition, such surveys are uploaded, following validation as part of the Historic Environment Record, by Historic England to the Archaeological Data Service ‘grey literature’ library (http://archaeologydataservice.ac.uk/archives/view/greylit/index.cfm). Although referred to as unpublished, this is a reflection that the results of an archaeological intervention or event (in this case the survey) are assessed and presented in grey reports/literature.  These may later form the basis of a formal publication in a journal or dedicated thematic or site book.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk 
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester 
LE1 6UB
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

