Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Acquiring Goods and Services 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the following information. 

You asked:

Please supply me with the following statistics for your Council for Goods and Services procurement where 'goods' are tangible products such as pens or computers, generally known as supplies; 'works' are "the construction or demolition of buildings, both residential and non-residential, repair to the fabric of these buildings, construction of roads, bridges, tunnels, and the installation of gas, electric, and plumbing services" and 'services' are the provision of an intangible product such as care or refuse collection, whether it is carried out internally or externally. The following payments should be EXCLUDED: foster carer payments; payments to pension funds; payments to other local authorities for placement of clients or other non-commercial activities; payments to individuals for expenses, insurance settlements, council tax refunds, etc; Benefits payments and transfer payments.

The figures should cover (unless stated) the period 1st April 2015 to the 31st March 2016.
1.
Total population of council's area.

Answer: Official estimates from the Office for National Statistics show the City’s population as 337,653 on 30th June 2014.  A comparable figure for last year is due to be released on 23rd June 2015, however at the time of writing this is the most up to date figure available.  Based on current projections we expect this to have increased by between 4,000 and 5,000 by mid-2015.
2.
Total value of Goods and Services acquired by the council from third party suppliers.
£119,857,487
3.
The total number of suppliers (contracted or not) that received a payment for Goods or services.

4,048

4.
Total value of goods and services acquired from third party suppliers by the council that were acquired under the terms of a contract whether arranged by the Council independently or by a collaboration with another Council or through participation in a Contract provided through a Framework.

This information is not held by the authority.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
5.
The total value of Goods and Services spent with suppliers whose head office/business address is in the area of the council.

£50,721,354

6.
The total number of invoices for goods and services paid by the council during the period 1st April 2015 to the 31st March 2016 whether or not the supplier was contracted to the council or the holder of a framework contract.

This information is not held by the authority therefore this is a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the Council
7.
The total number of contracts held by the council as at the 31st March 2016.

1,493
8.
The total value of third party spend acquired from contracts that were not exclusive to the council arranged with another council or through participation in a contract provided through a Framework.

As 4 above, this information is not held by the authority

9.
The total number of contracts held by the council as at the 31st March 2016 with formalised and active contract management (Formalised contract management is viewed as regular, recorded and communicated processes for reviewing progress, issues, performance, outputs and outcomes including remedial action linked to contract terms by a responsible individual or individuals or teams that is active).

This information is not held by the authority

10.
The total value of Goods and Services spent with suppliers who are defined as a Small and Medium Enterprise according to the DfTI definition.

This information is not held by the authority
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk 
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester 
LE1 6UB
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

