1. For each of the financial years 2006/07 to 2015/16:
(a) How many social/affordable rented homes did your authority own as of the end of the financial year?
Answer:
	
	Housing Stock at end of Year

	2006-07
	22,664

	2007-08
	22,446

	2008-09
	22,371

	2009-10
	22,297

	2010-11
	22,357

	2011-12
	22,286

	2012-13
	22,139

	2013-14
	21,956

	2014-15
	21,896

	2015-16
	Information not yet available


(b) How many tenancy enforcement cases involving cannabis cultivation occurred in your authority's social/affordable rented properties?
4

(c) How many tenant(s) were evicted as a result of cannabis cultivation?
2 - both in 2015

(d) How many tenant(s) received suspended/postponed possession orders as a result of cannabis cultivation?
One in 2013
2. For each of the financial years 2013/14, 2014/15, 2015/16:
How many of the cases involving cannabis cultivation identified in Q1 (b) occurred in properties affected by the 'bedroom tax'?
This information is not recorded.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk 
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester 
LE1 6UB
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

