Freedom of Information Act 2000 – domiciliary care 
Your request for information has now been considered.  The Council holds the following information. 

You asked:

1. (a) In total, how many adults received domiciliary care commissioned by the local authority from external providers in 2015/16?

Answer: 
2,601


(b) Of this total, how many were aged i) 18 -64 ii) 65+.

18-64
485

65+
2,116

2. In the past year (up to 29 July 2016),  what percentage of domiciliary care visits commissioned from external providers were delivered in

a) 15 minutes or less
2015/16
2%

2016/17 (up to 29/07/16)
2%


b) 16 – 30 minutes
2015/16
59%

2016/17 (up to 29/07/16)
59%
3. In total, how many adults who received domiciliary care commissioned by the local authority in the year 2015/16 received any visits lasting 15 minutes or less as part of their care package? 

145
4. In 2015/16 did the local authority commission any 15-minute visits for personal care? Please provide a copy of the local authority’s policy (or other relevant documents) on commissioning domiciliary care visits lasting 15 minutes or less.  

1,090
We do not have a policy on commissioning visits of less than 15 minutes duration, this being the lowest threshold we commission visits for in terms of duration.  Generally 30 minutes is the lowest commissioned duration, although 15 minute durations are commissioned for some case, such as double up visits when 2 carers are required for hoisting purposes or if an individual requires support to walk to the dining room in an extra care housing scheme.
5. In total, how many hours of domiciliary care were commissioned by the local authority from external providers in the year 2015/16? 

931,809

6. (a) In total, how many 

i) Complaints ii) Appeals 
81 statutory complaints were recorded.  

We don’t have a formal appeals process, so even if something is technically an appeal against a decision it would be addressed under the complaints process and defined as a complaint.
did the local authority receive related to a local authority decision made under Part 1 of the Care Act in the year 2015/16. 

(b) How many of these (i) complaints and (ii) appeals were upheld? 

79 of these complaints progressed to a conclusion and from these 13 were upheld and 14 were partially upheld
(If the local authority categorises these complaints and appeals please provide a breakdown across categories recorded). 

Complaint reasons

Adult Social Care’s statutory complaint database currently highlights 14 possible reasons for making a complaint.  The reasons behind a complaint are identified at the point of receipt, by the Complaints Team.

The chart below shows a more detailed breakdown of the complaint reasons identified during 2015/16 year.  Some complaints have more than one complaint reason against it.

[image: image1.png]Withdrawal of Service

Staff Punctuality

Staff Attitude / Behaviour
Safeguarding Concerns

Quality Issues

Provider Complaints

Poor Care Plan / Needs Not Met
Notice of Concern

Lack of Communication / Information
Inadequate Resources

Failure to Undertake Task
Delay in Receiving a Service
Challenging Practice Decision

Breach of Confidentiality

Complaint Reason

I}
I

e e e et

s

s

IS

[ —— 12
- 2
— 18
2
e s
— 5

S —— 37

I}

o 5 10 15 20

25 30 35 40





7. In 2015/16 how many people (a) requested and (b) received support from an independent advocate arranged by the local authority under s. 67 (2) of the Care Act 2014?
 
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
We a) do not record the number of requests made for advocacy, or b) record the number of advocacy cases where provision was instigated by the Local Authority.  We can only confirm that 402 service users and 276 carers received advocacy support during the 2015-16 year.  However, we are not able to define how many of these were arranged by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk 
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor, Rutland Wing

City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester
LE1 1FZ

e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
� � HYPERLINK "http://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2014/23/part/1/crossheading/independent-advocacy-support/enacted" �http://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2014/23/part/1/crossheading/independent-advocacy-support/enacted� 





