Freedom of Information Act 2000 – dog fouling
Your request for information has now been considered.  The Council holds the following information. 

You asked:

Regarding the issue of dog fouling in your local authority, and for the periods 2013, 2014, 2015 and 2016 year to date, could you please provide responses to the following questions:

	 
	2013
	2014
	2015
	2016

	How many fines did your local authority hand out for dog fouling?
	 52
	9
	0
	1

	How many reports of dog fouling were received by your local authority?
	Info. not held
	Info. not held
	Info. not held
	Info. not held

	What was the total value of fines handed out by your local authority out for dog fouling?
	 £4,160.00
	 £720.00
	 £0.00
	£80.00

	What was the average amount of revenue from fines handed out for dog fouling?
	 £2,390.00
	 £860.00
	 £480.00
	  £0.00

	Does your local authority require dog owners to carry a poop scoop and disposable bag when they take their dogs out to a public place?
	 No
	No
	No
	No


Answer: 

We do not hold the number of reports of dog fouling received by the authority as this data was recorded on our old system which is no longer in use and we cannot recover this information. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk 
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor, Rutland Wing

City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester
LE1 1FZ

e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
