You asked for:
Question 1 – Please confirm which of the following cycle training/promotion activities are currently being delivered throughout your Borough/County:

a)      School cycle training – Bikeability
Yes, in house.

b)      School cycle training – Non-Bikeability
Yes, Bike It – Sustrans through a grant agreement

c)       Bikeability Plus
Yes, Bikeability Balance, in house.

d)      Adult cycle training
Yes, in house.

e)      Cycle maintenance training
Yes, workshops are available.
f)       Dr Bike sessions
Yes, various providers funded via the £300 cycle challenge programme, see link below:
https://www.leicester.gov.uk/transport-and-streets/cycling-in-leicester/cycling-schemes/300-cycle-challenge/
g)      Cycle loan schemes
No.

h)      Cycle roadshows and/or other cycle promotion events
Yes, in house and with partner organisations.

Question 2 – For each of the above contract types/services, please provide the following:
a)      Name of contracted provider
Not applicable, services are delivered in house.

b)      Estimated annual value
Not applicable.

c)      Contract start date
Not applicable.

d)      Contract end date (including any extensions, existing or planned)
Not applicable.

e)      Annual volume of adults or children receiving contracted services
Not applicable.

f)       Expected date or timeline for when future contracts will be published
We are currently working on a framework contract and hope to have this advertised on Source Leicestershire by April 2017.

g)      How and when future contract opportunities will be published / advertised
Source Leicestershire

http://www.sourceleicestershire.co.uk/

h)      A copy of the current tender/bid proposal/request for quote that  resulted in the award of  these services to the current, incumbent service provider (please supply in .pdf format)
Not applicable.

Question 3 – Are there any plans to change the way in which cycle training services are to be delivered within the next 12-18 moths. If so, can you please outline such plans and identify which services will be included in these changes?

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council. Continuation of the current training programe is dependent on future funding.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

