You asked for:
This query relates to the right to rent provisions set out in the Immigration Acts 2014 and 2016, which are now established in law. These provisions require landlords to carry out immigration checks of tenants, and expose them to a civil penalty fine, or up to five years in prison for non-compliance. In addition they grant powers to landlords to evict tenants, including children, without a court order in certain circumstances. They are currently in force in England, and a further rollout is planned for Scotland, Wales and Northern Ireland. 

I am writing to enquire whether, in light of the above changes, or (depending on your area) planned changes, you could provide us with answers to the following questions:

1. Do you have a scheme in place regulating or licensing landlords in your area?
No. Mandatory HMO licensing scheme only.

2. Have you put in place any internal policies or guidance to assist the following teams, or others, to carry out their work in light of the right to rent scheme?

a. Housing team

b. Trading Standards team (in relation to letting agents)

c. Landlord licensing team   (if applicable)

Please provide copies of any such policies or guidance. 
No, therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of 
the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
3. Have you put in place any systems to monitor the impact of the right to rent scheme on:

a. Homelessness;

b. Discrimination;

Please provide copies of any documents, emails, meeting minutes relating to such monitoring efforts. 
No, therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
4. Are you providing training, outreach, or other engagement in respect of the right to rent scheme, for example to landlords, service users, or your staff? Please provide copies of training materials, or other related documents. 
No.

5. Are you taking any other action to ensure compliance with your Public Sector Equality Duty in relation to the right to rent scheme? If so, what?

LCC take seriously and consider its Duties under the Equality Act in how we provide services and make decisions across the Authority, however, there is no specific extra safeguards to compliance in relation to this Act as it is embedded within all our service provision already.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester
LE1 1FZ

e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

