You asked for:
(1)  How many households were in Council Tax Debt, and what was the total amount of Council Tax debt owed by these households, at the end of each financial year from 2003/04 to 2015/16?
	Period
	Council Tax Arrears outstanding
	Total number of households

	2003/04
	Information not held
	Information not held

	2004/05
	Information not held
	Information not held

	2005/06
	Information not held
	Information not held

	2006/07
	Information not held
	Information not held

	2007/08
	Information not held
	Information not held

	2008/09
	7,762,680.13
	Information not held

	2009/10
	7,511,539.94
	Information not held

	2010/11
	7,566,444.50
	Information not held

	2011/13
	8,339,976.53
	17,437

	2012/13
	9,194,623.31
	19,204

	2013/14
	10,905,177.36
	20,786

	2014/15
	12,047,067.75
	25,476

	2015/16
	13,059,717.23
	25,300


The Council does not hold the data for earlier years requested. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
 (2)  What was the total amount of Council Tax debt (a) repaid and (b) written off during the course of each financial year from 2003/04 to 2015/16? 
 
	Period
	Net debt repaid for all years

	2003/04
	£56,266,000

	2004/05
	£64,057,000

	2005/06
	£69,059,000

	2006/07
	£71,258,000

	2007/08
	£73,728,000

	2008/09
	£78,215,000

	2009/10
	£80,768,808

	2010/11
	£81,762,564

	2011/13
	£82,216,839

	2012/13
	£86,318,855

	2013/14
	£95,755,858

	2014/15
	£100,584,841

	2015/16
	£105,390,867


2b 

	Period
	Net Council Tax debt written off for all years

	2003/04
	Information not held

	2004/05
	Information not held

	2005/06
	Information not held

	2006/07
	Information not held

	2007/08
	Information not held

	2008/09
	£729,403.18

	2009/10
	1,068,200.26

	2010/11
	£892,646.71

	2011/12
	£699,192.22

	2012/13
	£772,662.93

	2013/14
	£1,229,407.00

	2014/15
	£1,126,430.28

	2015/16
	£1,309,415.41


Again, the Council does not hold the data for earlier years requested. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
(3)  With regard to the repayments stated in part (2), (a) how many of the households making repayments were doing so through a Debt Management Plan, and (b) how much was repaid through a Debt Management Plan?
(4)  How many objections to Debt Management Plan proposals have the council made in each of the financial years from 2010/11 to 2015/16?  Please indicate how many of these were objections to (a) initial DMP proposals, and (b) proposals for variation of an existing DMP.

Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

The information requested is not held in a reportable format. This data, if held, would be recorded on an individual’s case file and would require the manual trawl of all council tax arrears cases, in 2015/16 over 25,000 households were in arrears.
This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

