You asked:
1. Are celebrities/high profile guests paid when they attend council-run functions?

Answer: No not generally
2. Are celebrities paid to turn on the Merlyn Vaz Christmas tree lights and if so, who pays?
This is organised by Keith Vaz MP and his office and is not a Council-funded event.
3. Are they paid via a council budget?  
Please see the responses to questions 1 and 2.
If so:
4. How many council events have celebrities/high profile guests attended in Leicester in the past 5 years?
5. How much money has been paid to celebrities and guests over the past 5 years?
In respect of questions 4 and 5, The Council’s Children’s Social Care Directorate hosts the following events every year for Looked After Children which would include a celebrity guest:
Celebrating Success - awards evening celebrating the achievements of young people living in care aged 16 – 21 and

Stars In the Making - awards evening celebrating the achievements of young people living in care aged 11 – 15 

For the last five years Leicester Belgrave Mela have been commissioned to co-ordinate the events. 

The Council does not make these payments and therefore does not hold this information.  
Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

6. Who pays for the travel and accommodation for visiting overseas celebrities/guests to attend council functions and how much has been paid over the past 5 years?
The contractor or external provider/promoter pays for any celebrities/guests. 
No payment is made by the Council.
7. Are travel and accommodation costs paid for invited UK celebrities/high profile guests and, if so, is there a basic allowance or is it a negotiable amount?
8. Does the council have a specific budget for celebrity/high profile guests payments and if so, how is it funded - (i.e., central government/council tax)?

I've noticed that Mr Keith Vaz's family have also attended a number of engagements connected with the council. Therefore please could you tell me:
9. Has the council ever paid a fee to members of Mr Vaz's family to attend local engagement over the past 5 years, and if so, how much in total?

In respect of questions 7, 8 and 9, no payments have been made by the Council.

Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
The Speaker of the House of Commons, Mr John Bercow, is also regularly photographed at local events, so I'd like to know:

10. How many functions and events has he attended and has the council paid any costs or fees to Mr Bercow over the past 5 years and, if so, how much in total?
The Speaker of the House of Commons, John Bercow, attended an event on 4th March 2016 to unveil a sculpture in the city along with Keith Vaz. The Council did not pay a fee for him to attend and he was invited by a third party.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

