You asked for:
Pharmacy Services in Leicester in 2016:

Please could you supply the following information:

Q1 Has Leicester City Council had any discussions with the local pharmaceutical committee regarding the provision of health services by community pharmacies in your area?

(Please note, services may include but are not limited to smoking cessation, minor ailments, weight management, EHC, vascular risk checks, Chlamydia screening, vaccinations etc) 

Q2 Where such a discussion has been held, please could you give me the following details:
a) The date of the meeting 

b) A full list of the services discussed

c) A full list of the attendees

d) A copy of the minutes of the meetings 

Since 1 April 2016 the following meetings have taken place with the Leicester, Leicestershire and Rutland (LLR) Local Pharmaceutical Committee (LPC).

a) The date of the meeting – 16 May 2016 

b) A full list of the services discussed - Update about the Stop Smoking Service

c) A full list of the attendees:  LLR LPC members, Smoking Cessation Service Manager, Leicester City Council 

d) A copy of the minutes of the meetings – this was an LPC meeting. Please approach that body directly to request a list of attendees and any minutes if taken.

This letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
a) The date of the meeting – Wednesday 7th December 2016 11.00am 

b) A full list of the services discussed - Community Pharmacy 2016/17and Beyond and Healthy Living Pharmacy 

c) A full list of the attendees: Chief Officer of LLR LPC, Chair of the LLR LPC, Ivan Browne, Deputy Director, Consultant in Public Health, Leicester City Council .

d) A copy of the minutes of the meetings – none taken. This letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
a) The date of the meeting – Wednesday 7th December 2016 12.00 noon 

b) A full list of the services discussed- opportunities to put oral health on pharmacy agenda and in Healthy Living Pharmacy level 1.
c) A full list of the attendees Chief Officer of LLR LPC, Chair of the LLR LPC, a Oral Health Promoter and a Speciality Registrar in Public health,  Leicester City Council.

d) A copy of the minutes of the meetings – none taken. This letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
a) The date of the meeting – Wednesday 7th December 2016 12.30 pm

b) A full list of the services discussed - Chlamydia screening and Emergency Hormonal contraception. 

c) A full list of the attendees Chief Officer of LLR LPC, Chair of the LLR LPC, Public Health Principal, Leicester City Council 

d) A copy of the minutes of the meetings – none taken. This letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
Please note that junior staff names are exempt from release under Section 40(2) of The Act as they are personal data and the Council judges that disclosure to the wider world under the Act would constitute a breach of Data Protection principles, notably Principle 1-fair and lawful processing and Principle 2 – processing for specified and not incompatible purposes and this therefore acts as a refusal notice under s.17 of The Act.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

