You asked:
1) How many social care assessments were completed in the following financial years:
a)      2013/14

b)      2014/15

c)      2015/16

d)      2016/17 (Year to date)
Answer: 

Adult Social Care 

	Financial Year
	Total number of Assessments

	
	

	2014/15
	9,850

	2015/16
	8,124

	2016/17 (YTD)
	6,211


Information for 2013/14 is not held due to change of system that took place in April 2014.  Unfortunately, historical data cannot be reported on in this way due to changes in format that occurred during the migration process.  This is therefore a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the Council.

Children’s Social Care 
	Financial Year
	Single Assessments
	S47 Investigations

	2013/14
	-
	1,148

	2014/15
	2,795
	1,444

	2015/16
	3,061
	1,563

	2016/17 (YTD)
	2,691
	1,221


Information for single assessments for 2013/14 is not available due to national changes in assessment practice. This is therefore a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Act.

Nationally produced statistics are available at: https://www.gov.uk/government/collections/statistics-children-in-need 

2) Since 25th May 2010, what is the longest period of time an individual in your local authority has waited for a social care assessment from the date of the initial request?

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.  We can only provide data for the amount of time it took Leicester City Council to complete an assessment, from assessment ‘start date’ to assessment ‘completion date’. Our reports do not currently include an initial contact date.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

