You asked for:
1. A record of road accidents involving council vehicles during the 2015/16 and 2016/17 financial years.

For each accident please detail:

a) the date (DD/MM/YYYY) of the accidents

b) the number of people killed or injured, if applicable (if any fatalities, please state)

c) the department to which the vehicle belonged

d) a description of the accident, if possible

e) the location of the accident, if possible

Answer: Please see the attached document.
 

We are unable to ascertain injuries/fatalities on any accident as we do not hold this data. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.  This information is held by our Insurers who handle the claims on our behalf.
This information can be requested from Leicestershire Police via: https://leics.police.uk/about-us/our-departments/professional-standards/freedom/how-obtain-information.  
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

