FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I am asking for your support  in a student research study conducted by the University of Manchester into how decisions are made regarding active travel (walking, wheeling and cycling) in English local authorities. As part of this research, I am gathering information about how active travel interventions are evaluated and measured in local areas. I have looked at the material available on your website and have not been able to find the information below. I would be very grateful if you could complete the following questions. 

 

1.Name of local authority 
 Leicester City Council

2.Do you have an Active Travel Strategy?  Yes

If yes, please can you provide a copy of this (or link to the document)

 
We have two current strategies (for review 2026) and one in development strategy:

Cycle City Action Plan (current)

https://www.leicester.gov.uk/media/179027/leicester-cycle-city-action-plan.pdf
Walk Leicester Action Plan (current)

https://www.choosehowyoumove.co.uk/wp-content/uploads/2022/08/Walk-Leicester-Action-Plan-4.9.19.pdf
Local Cycling and Walking Infrastructure Plan  (in development - consultation concluded 2025)

https://consultations.leicester.gov.uk/transport/lcwip/supporting_documents/lcwip-draft-consultationpdf
3.Has your Local Authority set targets to increase active travel?  Yes /no

If yes, what are the targets and timescales for

 

	Mode of travel
	Target
	Date

	Cycling
	10% modal share of cycling to the city centre & quadruple cycling numbers by 2024
	2015 to 2024

(Cycle City Action Plan)

	Walking
	Reverse the decline in walking
	2015 to 2024

(draft Walk Leicester Action Plan)


 

 

 

 

 

4.What is your local authority’s performance on Active Travel England’s Cycling and Walking Investment Strategy 2 targets?

 

	Measure
	2018/19 performance
	2023/24
	2024/25

	Percentage of short journeys in towns and cities that are walked or cycled
	 

Not held - we do not record journey length information, only pure numbers

 

	Walking activity, measured as the total number of walking stage per person per year
	Not held - We do not hold or report based on walking stages but on overall trips

	Cycling activity, measured as the estimated total number of cycling stages made each year
	 

Not held - We do not hold or report based on cycling stages but on overall trips

 

	Percentage of children aged 5 to 10 who usually walk to school (Walking includes jogging, non-motorised scooters, prams, pushchairs, and toy bicycles.)
	 50%
	47% 
	62%


Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
NB - our monitoring and trip numbers are published on the Leicester open data platform under Transport - the Strategic Corden Survey is the primary data source
Strategic Cordon Survey - Data — Leicester Open Data 

5.Were any of these  funding sources used to provide initiatives to increase active travel (including infrastructure and promotion) in 2023/24?
1. Funding from Active Travel England  y/n Yes
2. Mainstream Council budgets y/n Yes

3. Public Health grant (or budget) funding y/n Yes
4. Other /external sources (please specify)……………………………..

DfT funding - Transforming Cities, Integrated Transport Block

Sustrans – investment in the National Cycle Network 

British Cycling – Community Coach Match-funding

Cycling UK – Big Bike Revival Funding

Developer Contributions secured via S106

Local business/organisation contributions
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
