Freedom of Information Act 2000 – benefit cap
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

1. How many households, affected by the benefit cap, are now receiving 50p a week in housing benefit?

Answer: 128
2. How many households (from question 1) would have their benefits reduced further if the cap could be applied to other types of benefits, as well as housing benefit?

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

The Local Authority is instructed by the Department for Work and Pensions to apply the cap.  The minimum Housing Benefit payment would be £0.50 per week.  We can only supply data on how Housing Benefit was capped and not any other benefits.
3. How many of the households (from question 1) were affected by the £26,000 cap?

40

4. How many of the households (from question 1) were receiving 50p a week housing benefit as a result of the £26,000 cap and would have their benefits reduced further if the cap could be applied to other types of benefits, as well as housing benefit?

Please see answer to question (2) above.

5. What is the average amount a household, which is currently receiving 50p a week in housing benefit, stands to lose once they move over to Universal Credit if they are over the threshold of the cap?

Universal Credit is not assessed by the Local Authority.  The Department for Work and Pensions assess Universal Credit.  
6. In total, how much less will be given each week in benefits to households in the area which are currently receiving 50p housing benefit when they are all moved over to universal credit and the cap can be fully applied?

As (2) above
7. What is the average amount of housing benefit reduction faced by the households who are now receiving 50p a week housing benefit and should have more taken from them if the cap could be applied to other benefits?

As (2) above
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 
